
 
 

Board of Commissioners 
March 19, 2026 6:30 PM City Hall - Massie Chambers 

 
 
 
Agenda: 
 
    
1.  Call to order by the Mayor  
    
  Prayer  
    
  Pledge of Allegiance  
    
2.  Roll call by the Recorder.   
    
3.  Comments from citizens.   
    
4.  Comments of the City Manager and staff.   
    
5.  Reports and comments from committees, members of the Board of Commissioners and 

other officers.   
    
6.  Consent agenda items.  
    
7.  Unfinished Business.  
  a. Consider Ordinance 26-1133, an ordinance to amend Ordinance 23-1076, an 

ordinance to amend Title 12, Chapter 1, of the Goodlettsville Municipal Code, 
being the Standard Building Code for the City of Goodlettsville. 
SECOND READING 

  b. Consider Ordinance 26-1135, an ordinance of the City of Goodlettsville, 
Tennessee, Board of Commissioners, amending the Goodlettsville Municipal 
Code relating to Emergency Services by creating a new Title 21 entitled 
Emergency Services and Chapter 1; establishing definitions; authorizing 
emergency powers of the City Manager; and providing for an effective date. 
SECOND READING 

Page 1 of 253



  c. Consider Resolution 26-1319, a resolution of the Board of Commissioners of the 
City of Goodlettsville, Tennessee, to establish an Infrastructure Development 
District relating to the residential development, Copper Valley, located on 
Moncrief Avenue and being developed by Last of the Loggers, a Limited Liability 
Corporation. 

    
8.  New Business.   
  a. Consider Ordinance 26-1136, an ordinance to amend the official Zoning Map of 

Goodlettsville adopted per Ordinance 15-851 by changing the zoning of a 
property on Springfield Highway 41/SR 11 from CPUD, Commercial Planned Unit 
Development Limited to CG, Commercial General. FIRST READING 

  b. Consider Ordinance 26-1137, an ordinance to amend the official Zoning Map of 
Goodlettsville adopted per Ordinance 15-851 by changing the zoning of property 
on Dry Creek Road from HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit 
Development to CPUD, Commercial Planned Unit Development. FIRST READING 

  c. Consider Ordinance 26-1138, an ordinance to amend the official Zoning Map of 
Goodlettsville adopted per Ordinance 15-851 by changing the zoning of a 
property on Dry Creek Road and Old Dickerson Road from HDRPUD, High 
Density Residential Planned Unit Development to MDRPUD, Medium Density 
Residential Planned Unit Development and Dry Creek Farms Master Plan 
amendment. FIRST READING 

  d. Consider Ordinance 26-1139, an ordinance of the City of Goodlettsville, 
Tennessee amending the fiscal year 2025-2026 budget, passed by Ordinance 25-
1112. FIRST READING 

  e. Consider Resolution 26-1322, a resolution of the Board of Commissioners of the 
City of Goodlettsville expressing opposition to Tennessee Senate Bill 2311 and 
Tennessee House Bill 2419 regarding county approval of municipal annexations 
within established Urban Growth Boundaries. 

  f. Consider Resolution 26-1323, a resolution of the Board of Commissioners of the 
City of Goodlettsville expressing opposition to Tennessee Senate Bill 2064 and 
Tennessee House Bill 1873 relating to the imposition of a property tax cap on 
local governments. 

  g. Consider Resolution 26-1324, a resolution of the City of Goodlettsville, 
Tennessee, Board of Commissioners establishing a policy allowing governing 
body members to participate in meetings by electronic means under specific 
circumstances. 

  h. Consider Resolution 26-1325, a resolution declaring certain property surplus to 
the needs of the City of Goodlettsville and calling for its disposal by online 
auction or any other reasonable manner. 

  i. Consider Resolution 26-1326, a resolution of the City of Goodlettsville, 
Tennessee, Board of Commissioners confirming compliance and review of 

Page 2 of 253



financial policies and authorizing an application for the Comptroller's Financial 
Excellence Award.  

  j. Consider Resolution 26-1327, a resolution of the City of Goodlettsville, 
Tennessee, Board of Commissioners approving a contract with the State of 
Tennessee for an America 250 Grant as a part of the Semi-Quincentennial 
Celebration. 

    
9.  Adjournment.  

 
 
 

For more information regarding this agenda, please contact the city recorder by email at: 
abaker@goodlettsville.gov  

A government committed to operating with efficiency and integrity in all we do as we strive to 
enhance the quality of life for the community we serve. 

105 S. Main Street – Goodlettsville, TN 37072 – 615-851-2200 – Fax 615-851-2212     
 www.goodlettsville.gov 

 

Page 3 of 253

mailto:abaker@goodlettsville.gov
https://www.goodlettsville.gov/


 

AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET 
Board of Commissioners  

City of Goodlettsville 
 
 

 
SUBJECT TITLE:  Ordinance 26-1133 
An ordinance to amend Ordinance 23-1076, 
being an ordinance to amend Title 12, Chapter 1, 
of the Goodlettsville Municipal Code, being the 
Standard Building Code for the City of 
Goodlettsville. SECOND READING 
 
PRESENTED BY:   Tim Ellis, City Manager 
                                
                                
 

 
Agenda Item:  Ordinance 26-1133 
 
Dept. of Origin: Community Development 
 
For Agenda of:  March 19, 2026 
 
Originator:  Mike Bauer 
 
Cost of Item: N/A 
 

 
 

AGENDA ITEM ATTACHMENTS: 
Ordinance 26-1133 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
An ordinance to amend Ordinance 23-1076, being an ordinance to amend Title 12, Chapter 1, of the 
Goodlettsville Municipal Code, being the Standard Building Code for the City of Goodlettsville 
 
FINANCIAL SUMMARY: 
N/A 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Staff recommends approval of Ordinance 26-1133. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 4 of 253



 
ORDINANCE 26-1133 

 
 
AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND ORDINANCE NO. 23-1076, BEING AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND TITLE 12, 
CHAPTER 1, OF THE GOODLETTSVILLE MUNICIPAL CODE, BEING THE STANDARD BUILDING CODE FOR 
THE CITY OF GOODLETTSVILLE 
  
WHEREAS, by ordinance No. 23-1076, passed on second reading on January 11, 2024, the City of 
Goodlettsville adopted the 2018 Edition of the International Code Council (ICC) Building Code, 
Residential Code, Fuel Gas Code, Mechanical Code, Plumbing Code, Existing Building Code, Energy 
Conservation Code, Property maintenance Code, Fire Code and the ICC / ANSI A117.1-2003 (Standard on 
Accessible and Usable Buildings and Facilities), and 
  
WHEREAS, all previously mentioned codes and standards were adopted by reference as though fully 
copied in ordinance No. 23-1076, and 
  
WHEREAS, the ICC has published updated editions of the previously mentioned codes and standards and 
has designated them as 2024 Editions, and 
  
WHEREAS, the best interests of the City of Goodlettsville and its citizens are served by adopting the 
updated versions of the previously mentioned codes and standards; 
  
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF THE CITY OF 
GOODLETTSVILLE THAT: 

1. Goodlettsville Municipal Code Section 12-101(Building code and one and two family dwelling 
code) is amended by deleting the existing section and substituting in its place the following: 
 
a. The 2024 Edition of the ICC International Building Code. 
b. The 2024 Edition of the ICC International Residential Code. 
c. The 2024 Edition of the ICC International Fuel Gas Code 
d. The 2024 Edition of the ICC International Mechanical Code 
e. The 2024 Edition of the ICC International Plumbing Code 
f. The 2024 Edition of the ICC International Existing Building Code 
g. The 2024 Edition of the ICC International Property maintenance Code 
h. The 2018 Edition of the ICC International Energy Conservation Code 
I. The 2024 Editon of the ICC International Pool and Spa Code. 
J.  The 2017 ICC / ANSI A117.1 – (Standard on Accessible and Usable Buildings and Facilities). 

  
BE IT FURTHER ORDAINED THAT EACH CODE AND STANDARD PREVIOUSLY MENTIONED IS ADOPTED 
BY REFERENCE AS THOUGH FULLY COPIED HEREIN. 
 
 
 

Page 5 of 253



BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT SECTION 12-102 OF THE GOODLETTSVILLE MUNICIPAL CODE IS 
AMENDED BY DELETING THE ENTIRE PARAGRAPH AND REPLACING IT WITH THE FOLLOWING: 
  

Within said ICC 2024 International Building Code and the ICC 2024 International Residential 
Code, and any subsequent revisions or additions thereunto, when reference is made to the 
duties of certain officials names therein, that designated official of the City of Goodlettsville, 
Tennessee, who has duties corresponding to those of the named official in said code shall be 
deemed to be the responsible official insofar as enforcing the provisions of said code are 
concerned. 
 

  
BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THE 2024 INTERNATIONAL BUIDLING CODE IS AMENDED WITH THE 
FOLLOWING STIPULATIONS: 

 
1. Appendix I (Patio Covers) is adopted by reference. 

 
2. Delete Section 1612 Flood Loads. (Locally adopted Flood Ordinance will be used). 

 
3. Section 202 Definitions: added two items 

a. NORMAL MAINTENANCE REPAIRS – shall be defined as repairs to an existing 
building or structure, including but not limited to exterior and interior painting, 
papering, and window and door maintenance, minor repairs to chimneys, stairs, 
porches, floor re-finishing, underpinning, and re-roofing. The replacement of roof 
sheathing over 100 square feet, as well as the alteration or movement of any 
structural building components, does not fall under the purview of normal 
maintenance. 
 

b. TEMPORARY – shall mean no longer than 90 calendar days. 
 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THE 2024 INTERNATIONAL RESIDENTIAL CODE IS AMENDED WITH 
THE FOLLOWING STIPULATIONS: 

 

                     1. Appendix BF- Patio Covers 

       2. Appendix BE - Radon control methods (Davidson County Only) 

                     3.    Chapter 2 - Definitions: added two items 
a. NORMAL MAINTENANCE REPAIRS – shall be defined as repairs to an existing 

building or structure, including but not limited to exterior and interior painting, 
papering, and window and door maintenance, minor repairs to chimneys, stairs, 
porches, floor re-finishing, underpinning, and re-roofing. The replacement of roof 
sheathing, as well as the alteration or movement of any structural building 
components, does not fall under the purview of normal maintenance. 
 

b. TEMPORARY – shall mean no longer than 90 calendar days.  

 

Page 6 of 253



 
 

4.    Table R301.2  
                                                                      Climatic and Geographic Design Criteria 

Ground Snow Load 15 pounds 
Wind speed 105 mph 
Topographic effects No 
Special Wind Region No 
Windborne Debris Zone No 
Seismic Design Category C 
Subject to Damage from Weathering Severe 
Subject to Damage from frost line depth (inches) 12 inches 
Subject to Damage from Termites  Heavy 
Winter Design Temp (degrees)  14 Degrees, Fahrenheit 
Ice Barrier Underlayment Required No 
Flood Hazards See City Flood Ordinance 
Air Freezing Index 366 
Mean Annual Temperature 59 Degrees Fahrenheit 
Manual J Design Criteria Elevation (feet) 640 
Latitude (Degrees North) 36 
Winter Heating 14 
Summer Cooling 94 
Altitude Correction Factor * 
Indoor Design Temperature 70 
Design Temperature Cooling 75 
Heating Temperature Difference * 
Cooling Temperature Difference * 
Wind Velocity Cooling * 
Coincident Wet Bulb 74 
Daily Range M 
Winter Humidity * 
Summer Humidity * 

  *This value to be determined using Manual J Design criteria.  

 

 

         5. Section R306 of the 2024 Edition of the International Residential Code for one and two 
               Family Dwellings is hereby amended by deleting Section R306 in its entirety. The City   
               of Goodlettsville Adopted Flood Ordinance will be the ruling document.  

              Section R317.5 of the 2024 Edition of the International Residential Code for one and two 
       Family Dwellings is hereby amended by deleting Section R317.5 in its entirety. 
 
 

Page 7 of 253



 
 
6.   Section R309 of the 2024 Edition of the International Residential Code for one and two 
      Family Dwellings is hereby amended by creating a new Section R309.1. 
  
 Section R309.1 Townhouse automatic fire sprinkler systems.  A townhouse shall be    

considered a separate building with independent exterior walls and shall be separated 
by a two-hour fire-resistance rated wall assembly.  A townhouse shall be built according 
to local and statewide adopted building codes; provided, however a fire sprinkler 
system shall not be required for a townhouse. For the purposes of this Code, 
“townhouse” means a single family dwelling unit constructed in a group of three (3) or 
more attached units that extends from foundation to roof, not more than three (3) 
stories in height, with a separate means of egress, and a open space of public way on at 
least two(2) sides.  

 
7. Section 309.2 of the 2024 Edition of the International Residential Code for One and Two  

Family Dwellings is hereby amended by deleting Section R309.2 in its entirety.  
 

        8.   Section 302.13 Exception 2 amended to read: Floor assemblies located directly over  
              a crawl space not intended for storage, with a standard opening of 18 inches by 

                            24 inches, or; for the installation of fuel fired or electric - powered heating appliances. 
 
         9. Chapter 11 of the 2024 Edition of the International Residential Code for one- and two- 
                family dwellings is hereby amended by: 

a. Section N1102.1.2 Maximum Assembly U-Factors and Fenestration 
Requirements and Table N1102.1.3 Insulation Minimum R-values and 
Fenestration Requirements by Component are hereby amended by 
deleting them and replacing them with Table N1102.1.2 Maximum 
Assembly U-Factors and Minimum R-Values and fenestration 
Requirements by Component from the 2009 International Residential 
Code.  

b. Section N1102.5.1.2 (R402.5.1.2) Air Leakage Testing Is hereby 
amended by deleting it in its entirety, and replacing it with Section 
N1102.4.2.2.; Visual Inspection from the 2009 International Residential 
Code.   

c. Section N11.3.3.7 (R403.3.7) Duct system Testing (Mandatory) and 
Section N1103.3.8) Duct System Leakage (Prescriptive) are optional.   

d.  Section N1102.4.4 (R402.4.4) Rooms containing Fuel-Burning Appliances 
is deleted in its entirety.  

e. Table N1102.1 Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component 
in the 2009 edition is adopted and amended by adding the following as 
footnote “I”: “Log walls complying with ICC 400 and with a minimum 

Page 8 of 253



average wall thickness of 5” or greater shall be permitted in Zone 3 and 
when a Fenestration U-Factor of .50 or lower is used, a skylight U-Factor 
of .65 or lower is used, a Glazed Fenestration SHGC of .30 or lower is 
used, a 90 AFUE Furnace is used, an 85 AFUE Boiler is used, and a 9.0 
HSPF Heat Pump (heating) and 15 SEER (cooling) are used.  

f. Table N1102.1 Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component 
in the 2009 edition is adopted and amended by adding the following as 
footnote “m”: “Log walls complying with ICC 400 and with a minimum 
average wall thickness of 5” or greater shall be permitted in Zone 4 and 
when a Fenestration U-Factor of .35 or lower is used, a Factor of .60 or 
lower is used, a 90 AFUE Furnace is used, an 85 AFUE Boiler is used, and 
a 9.0 HSPF Heat Pump skylight U- (heating) and 15 SEER (cooling) are 
used. 

 
  
         10.  Section P2603.5 of the 2018 Edition of the International Residential Code for One and 
  Two family dwellings is hereby amended by deleting Section P2603.5 and substituting  
  the following: 
   

P2603.5. Freezing. Plumbing fixtures, water, soil and waste pipes shall not be installed 
outside of a building, in attics or crawl spaces, concealed in outside walls, or in any other 
places subject to freezing temperatures unless adequate provision is made to protect 
such pipes from freezing by insulation of heat or both. Exterior water supply system 
piping shall be installed not less than eighteen (12) inches below grade. 

 
11. Section P2801.5 of the 2024 Edition of the International Residential Code for 

One and Two family dwellings is hereby amended by deleting Section P2801.5 
and substituting the following: 

 
P2801.5. Required Pan. Where a storage tank-type water heater or a hot water 
storage tank is installed in a location where water leakage from the tank will 
cause damage, the tank shall be installed in a pan constructed of one of the 
following: 

         1. Galvanized steel or aluminum of not less than 0.0236 inches in thickness. 

          2. Plastic pans no less than 0.036 in thickness. 

          3. Other approved materials.  

               A plastic pan beneath a gas-fired water heater shall be constructed of material having a 
flame spread index of 25 or less and a smoke-development index of 450 or less when 
tested in accordance with ASTM E84 or UL 723 

 

Page 9 of 253



 Exception: When water heaters are installed in a crawl space or in a basement without 
living space, no pan shall be required.  

 Water heater relief valve piping shall terminate 6 to 10 inches above the floor.  

        12. Section P2903.5 of the 2024 Edition of the International Residential Code for One and 
  Two family dwellings is hereby amended by deleting Section P2903.5 and substituting  
  the following: 
 

P2903.5. Water Hammer.   The flow velocity of the water distribution system shall be 
controlled to reduce the possibility of water hammer. A water-hammer arrestor shall be 
installed where quick-closing valves are utilized. Water hammer arrestors shall be 
installed per the plan design, but at a minimum at all washing machines, dishwashers 
and standalone ice makers. Water-hammer arrestors shall conform to ASSE 1010. 

  

        13. Section P2903.9.1 of the 2024 Edition of the International Residential Code for One and 
  Two family dwellings is hereby amended by deleting Section P2903.9.1 and substituting  
  the following: 
   
  P2903.9.1. Service Valve.  A main shut-off valve on the water service line shall be  
  installed for each dwelling unit within a building and shall be accessible in the living  
  portion of the dwelling unit or an attached garage. Additionally, the water service shall  
  shall be valved at the curb or property line in accordance with local requirements.  
 
        14.  Chapter 19 of the 2024 Edition of the International Residential Code is hereby  
  amended by adding section M1901.3. 
   
  M1901.3. Prohibited Location. Cooking appliances designed, tested, listed or labeled 
  for use in commercial occupancies shall not be installed within dwelling units or within 
  any area where domestic cooking operations occur.  
  

      15.   Section G2417.1.1 of the 2025 Edition of the International Residential Code for One and 
  Two family dwellings is hereby amended by deleting Section G2417.1.1 and substituting  
  the following: 
 
  G2417.1.1 Inspections.  On completion of the installation, alteration, repair or 
  replacement of gas piping, and prior  the use thereof, the building official shall  
  be notified that the gas piping is ready for inspection.  
 

      16.   Section G2417.1 of the 2024 Edition of the International Residential Code for One and 
  Two family dwellings is hereby amended by adding Section G2417.1.1.3, G2417.1.1.4 

 and G2417.1.1.5 
 
 G2417.1.1.3. Rough fuel-gas inspection.  This inspection shall be made after gas piping 
 authorized by the permit has been installed and before such piping has been covered or  

Page 10 of 253



 concealed or a fixture or appliance has been attached thereto. This inspection shall  
 include a determination that the gas piping size, material and installation meets the  
 requirements of this chapter. It shall also include an air pressure test at which time the  
 gas piping shall stand a pressure of not less than 30 pounds per square inch gauge  
 (68.9 kPa gauge) and shall hold this pressure for a length of time of no less than twenty  
 (20) minutes, with no perceptible drop in pressure. The test shall be made using air  
 pressure only. Necessary apparatus for conducting the test shall be furnished by the  
 permit holder.  
 
 G2417.1.1.4 Gas Meter Release Inspection. Gas meter release inspection shall be  
 conducted when all  fuel gas appliances are connected to the gas pipe system or  
 plugged with a cast iron plug. All appliance venting shall be in place at the time of the 
 meter release inspection. A shut-off valve in the off position with no appliance  
 connected, shall not be an acceptable termination of the building gas pipe.   
  
 

  G2417.1.1.5. Final Inspection.  This inspection shall be made after piping authorized by  
  the permit has been installed and after all portions thereof which are to be covered or  
  concealed and after all fixtures, venting, appliances, shut off valves, and cast iron plugs 

 have been installed.  
 

       17. Section G2417.4.1 of the 2024 Edition of the International Residential Code for One and 
  Two family dwellings is hereby amended by deleting Section G2417.4.1 and substituting  
  the following: 
 

 G2417.4.1. Air Pressure Test. This inspection shall be made after gas piping 
 authorized by the permit has been installed and before such piping has been covered or  
 concealed or a fixture or appliance has been attached thereto. This inspection shall  
 include a determination that the gas piping size, material and installation meets the  
 requirements of this chapter. It shall also include an air pressure test at which time the  
 gas piping shall stand a pressure of not less than 30 pounds per square inch gauge  
 (68.9 kPa gauge) and shall hold this pressure for a length of time of no less than twenty  
 (20) minutes, with no perceptible drop in pressure. The test shall be made using air  
 pressure only. Necessary apparatus for conducting the test shall be furnished by the  
 permit holder.  

 
 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THE 2024 INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE IS AMENDED WITH THE  
FOLLOWING STIPULATIONS: 

 

   1. 2024 Edition of the International Plumbing Code Published by the International Code         
Council, adopted with Appendices B, C, D and E. 

         2.    Section 305.4 of the 2024 Edition of the International Plumbing Code is   
        hereby amended by deleting Sections 305.4 and substituting the following:       

Page 11 of 253



 
305.4. Freezing. Plumbing fixtures, water, soil and waste pipes shall not be installed 
outside of a building, in attics or crawl spaces, concealed in outside walls, or in any other 
places subject to freezing temperatures unless adequate provision is made to protect 
such pipes from freezing by insulation of heat or both. Exterior water supply system 
piping shall be installed not less than eighteen (12) inches below grade. 
 

        3.    Section 312.3 of the 2024 Edition of the International Plumbing Code is   
        hereby amended by adding Section 312.3.1 with the following language:       

 
312.3.1 Drainage and vent air test. Plastic piping shall not be tested using air. An air test 
shall be made by forcing air into the system until there is a uniform gauge pressure of 
5psi (34.5 kPa) or sufficient to balance a 10-inch column of mercury. This pressure shall 
be held for a test period of not less than 15 minutes. Any adjustments to the test 
pressure required because of changes in ambient temperatures or the seating of gaskets 
shall be made prior to the beginning of the test period.  
 
Exception: Air testing on plastic pipe shall be permissible when water is not readily 
available or when the temperature is forecast to be below 32 degrees. 

 
 

         4.  Section 503.1 of the 2024 Edition of the International Plumbing Code is hereby        
amended by deleting Section 503.1 and substituting the following: 

 
503.1. Cold water line valve. The cold water branch line front the main water supply 
line to each hot water storage tank or water heater shall be provided with a shutoff 
valve, located within 3 feet of the equipment and serving only the hot water storage 
tank or water heater. The valve shall not interfere or cause a disruption of the cold 
water supply to the remainder of the cold water system. The valve shall be provided 
with access on the same floor level as the water heater served. 

         5. Section 604.9 of the 2024 Edition of the International Plumbing Code is hereby        
amended by deleting Section 604.9 and substituting the following: 

 604.9. Water Hammer.   The flow velocity of the water distribution system shall be 
controlled to reduce the possibility of water hammer. A water-hammer arrestor shall be 
installed where quick-closing valves are utilized. Water hammer arrestors shall be 
installed per the plan design, but at a minimum at all washing machines, dishwashers 
and standalone ice makers. Water-hammer arrestors shall conform to ASSE1010. 

         6. Section 903.1.1 of the 2024 Edition of the International Plumbing Code is hereby        
amended by inserting the following number: 

 903.1.1 Roof extension unprotected. Open Vent pipes that extend thru a roof shall be 
terminated not less than 12 inches above the roof.    

Page 12 of 253



 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THE 2024 INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE IS AMENDED WITH THE 
FOLLOWING STIPULATIONS: 

         1.   Appendices A, B, and C are adopted by reference.  
 
         2.   Section 406.4 of the 2024 International Fuel Gas Code is hereby amended by deleting  
  Sections 406.4.1 and 406.4.2 and substituting the following: 
  
 406.4.1. Method of testing. Gas piping shall withstand a pressure test of 30 psi for  
 a period of twenty (20) minutes without showing and drop in pressure.  

  

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THE 2024 INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE IS AMENDED WITH 
THE FOLLOWING STIPULATIONS: 

 1. Appendix A is adopted by reference.  
 

 BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THE 2018 INTERNATIONAL ENERGY CODE IS AMENDED WITH THE 
FOLLOWING STIPULATIONS: 

1. The 2018 Edition of the International Energy Conservation Code, published by the 
International Code Council (ICC), except for the following amendments: 
  

a.  Section R402.4.1.2 testing is deleted and replaced with Section R402.4.2.1 Testing 
Option, and Section 402.4.2.2 Visual Inspection option from the 2009 IEEC. 
 

b.  Section R403.3.3 Duct Testing (Mandatory) and Section R403.3.4 Duct Leakage 
testing (Prescriptive) are optional. 
 

c.  Table 402.1.2 Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component and Table 
R402.1.4 Equivalent U-Factors are deleted and replaced with Table 402.1.1 
Insulation and Fenestration Requirements by Component and Table 402.1.3 
Equivalent U-Factors 2009IECC. 

 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT THE 2024 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE IS 
AMENDED WITH THE FOLLOWING STIPULATIONS: 

 1. Appendix A Boarding Standard. 

                            2. Section 302.4 amended to read: Section 302.4 of the International Property   
                                Maintenance Code shall read: 302.4 Weeds. All premises and exterior 
     property shall be maintained free from weeds or plant growth in excess of Nine 
     (9”) inches in height. All noxious plant growth shall be prohibited. Weeds shall be 

all grasses, annual plants and vegetation other than trees or shrubs provided;       
however, this term shall not include cultivated flowers or gardens. 

 
             3. Add section 302.10 “Graffiti” to Section 302 Exterior Property Areas.  
   

Page 13 of 253



            302.10 Graffiti 
 

302.10.1 General. 
The purpose of this section is to help prevent the spread of graffiti 
vandalism and to establish a program for the removal of graffiti from 
public and private property. Graffiti is a public nuisance and 
destructive of the rights and values of property owners as well as the 
entire community. Unless action is taken to remove graffiti from 
public and private property, the graffiti tends to remain. Other 
properties then become the target of graffiti, and entire 
neighborhoods are affected and become less desirable places in 
which to be, all to the detriment of the City. 

 
It is intended, through the adoption of this Ordinance, to provide 
additional enforcement tools to protect public and private property 
from acts of vandalism and defacement. 

 
302.10.2 Definitions. 

 
"Graffiti" shall mean any unauthorized inscription, word, figure, 
painting or other defacement that is written, marked, etched, 
scratched, sprayed, drawn, painted, or engraved on or otherwise 
affixed to any surface of public or private property by any graffiti 
implement, to the extent that the graffiti was not authorized in 
advance by the owner or occupant of the property, or, despite 
advance authorization, is otherwise deemed a public nuisance. 

 
"Property" shall mean a building structure, garage, shed, fence, 
deck, signage, culvert, bridge, landing or other improvement to a 
parcel of land, or the public way.

Page 14 of 253



"Reasonable Time" shall mean five {5} calendar days from the posting of the property unless 
the Codes Director of their designee shall approve a greater period of time. 

 
"Remove(al)" shall mean to obliterate and eliminate graffiti by such 
means as will restore the property to its condition existing prior to 
defacement by graffiti. 

 
"Public Nuisance" shall mean anything which endangers life or 
health, gives offense to the senses, violates the laws of decency, or 
obstructs the reasonable and comfortable use of property. 

 
302.10. Graffiti Prohibited 

 
1. It shall be unlawful for any person to paint, inscribe, mark, or 
otherwise apply graffiti on any public or private property located 
within the corporate limits of the city. 

 
2. It shall be unlawful for the owner of any property to permit 
graffiti to remain in a manner visible to persons using right-of-ways 
and public or private parking areas to the general public, provided 
the Codes Director or their designee has given the property owner 
proper notice to remove the graffiti within the specified period as 
prescribed in Sections 107.2 and 107.3 of the International 
Property Maintenance Code, 2006 Edition, and said period has 
elapsed. 

 
302.10.4 Hardship. 

 
1. In the event a private property owner has a financial hardship and 
the Codes Director or their designee determines that graffiti is 
located on private property in a manner visible to persons using 
right-of-way accessible to the general public, the City Manager is 
authorized to provide for the removal. Said funds and materials 
shall come from the Public Works operating budget. 

 
2. Financial hardship must be verified by appropriate 
documentation provided by the property owner to the City of 
Goodlettsville or their designee and verified at an income level at 
or below 50% of the median income as stated by the United States 
Census Bureau for Metropolitan Nashville, Davidson County. 

Page 15 of 253



 
3. The City Manager shall not authorize the undertaking that 
provides for the painting or repair of any more extensive area than 
the area where the graffiti is located. 

 
 

302.10.5 Violations and Penalties for Non-Removal. 
It shall be unlawful for any person, firm, corporation, agent, or 
government entity to violate or fail to comply with a Notice of 
Violation to remove graffiti from their property. Any violations of 
this section or Property Maintenance Code as herein adopted and 
as herein adopted and modified shall be punishable by a fine of fifty 
dollars ($50.00} for each day or portion thereof that a violation 
continues after due notice has been served and shall be  
considered separate offenses. 

 
302.10.6 Community Service: Alternative Remedy 

The City Manager or their designee shall be authorized to offer 
any violator of this ordinance an option to perform such 
community service as the City Manager or their designee deems 
appropriate. 

 
302.10.7 Appeals. 

An appeal from any final decision of the Codes Director or their 
designee may be made in accordance with application for appeals as 
outlined in Section 111 of this code. 

 

  4. Section 304.2 is deleted in its entirety and replaced with the following language: 

  

   Section 304.2: Protective treatment: 

             All exterior surfaces, including but not limited to doors, door and  
window frames, cornices, porches, trim, balconies, decks and 

fences shall be maintained in good condition. Exterior wood 

surfaces, other than decay resistant woods, shall be protected 

from the elements and decay by painting or other protective 

covering or treatment. Peeling flaking and chipped paint shall be 

eliminated and surfaces repainted. All exterior surfaces shall be 

repainted in a low reflective, subtle, neutral or earth tone colors. 

The use of high intensity or metallic paints colors shall be prohibited 

Page 16 of 253



except for accents. All paint colors shall encompass the entire 

surface. All siding and masonry joints as well as those between the 

building envelope and the perimeter of windows, doors, and 

skylights shall be maintained weather resistant and water tight. All 

metal surfaces shall be coated to inhibit such rust and corrosion and 

shall be stabilized and coated to inhibit future rust and corrosion. 

All metal surfaces shall be coated in a low reflective, subtle, neutral 

or earth tone colors. The use of high intensity or metallic coating 

colors shall be prohibited except for accents. All coatings shall 

encompass the entire surface. Oxidation stains shall be removed 

from exterior surfaces. All oxidized surfaces shall be repainted or 

coated in a low reflective. subtle, neutral or earth tone colors. 

The use of high intensity or metallic paint or coating colors shall be 

prohibited except for accents. All paint or coating colors shall 

encompass the entire surface. 

 4. Add section 308.3.3 Special Event / Temporary Dumpsters 

   Special event and temporary dumpsters shall be allowed for no  

   more than 30 days. Dumpsters shall not be placed in a roadway 

   where they obstruct a lane of traffic.  Construction dumpsters  

   must be removed upon receipt of the Certificate of Occupancy 

   for the project.                 

 
LASTLY, BE IT ORDAINED THAT THIS ORDINANCE SHALL TAKE EFFECT FIFTEEN (15) DAYS AFTER ITS 
FINAL PASSAGE, THE WELFARE OF THE CITIZENS OF GOODLETTSVILLE REQUIRING IT. 
  
_________________________                                           
Rusty Tinnin, Mayor                                                             Passed first reading:     
                                        
_________________________                                          Passed second reading:     
Allison Baker, City Recorder                                                                                     
  
APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY 
  
_________________________ 
Russell Freeman, City Attorney  

Page 17 of 253



 

AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET 
Board of Commissioners  

City of Goodlettsville 
 
 

 
SUBJECT TITLE:  Ordinance 26-1135 
An ordinance of the City of Goodlettsville, 
Tennessee, Board of Commissioners, amending 
the Goodlettsville Municipal Code relating to 
Emergency Services by creating a new Title 21 
entitled Emergency Services and Chapter 1; 
establishing definitions; authorizing emergency 
powers of the City Manager; and providing for an 
effective date. SECOND READING 
 
PRESENTED BY:   Tim Ellis, City Manager 
                                
                                
 

 
Agenda Item:  Ordinance 26-1135 
 
Dept. of Origin: Administration 
 
For Agenda of:  March 19, 2026 
 
Originator:  Tim Ellis 
 
Cost of Item: N/A 
 

 
 

AGENDA ITEM ATTACHMENTS: 
Ordinance 26-1135 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
An ordinance of the City of Goodlettsville, Tennessee, Board of Commissioners, amending the 
Goodlettsville Municipal Code relating to Emergency Services by creating a new Title 21 entitled 
Emergency Services and Chapter 1; establishing definitions; authorizing emergency powers of the City 
Manager; and providing for an effective date. 
 
FINANCIAL SUMMARY: 
N/A 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Staff recommends approval of Ordinance 26-1135. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 18 of 253



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1135 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF GOODLETTSVILLE, TENNESSEE, BOARD OF 
COMMISSIONERS, AMENDING THE GOODLETTSVILLE MUNICIPAL CODE 
RELATING TO EMERGENCY SERVICES BY CREATING A NEW TITLE 21 
ENTITLED EMERGENCY SERVICES AND CHAPTER 1; ESTABLISHING 
DEFINITIONS; AUTHORIZING EMERGENCY POWERS OF THE CITY MANAGER; 
AND PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE. 

WHEREAS, the City of Goodlettsville is authorized pursuant to the Tennessee Emergency 
Management Act of 1986, codified at Tennessee Code Annotated, Title 58, Chapter 2, to exercise 
emergency powers for the protection of public health, safety, and welfare; and 

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners finds it necessary and appropriate to clarify local 
emergency powers and administrative authority during declared or actual emergencies. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF 
THE CITY OF GOODLETTSVILLE, TENNESSEE: 

SECTION 1. 

Title 21, “Emergency Services,” Chapter 1 - Article I, “In General,” is hereby adopted and/or 
amended to read as follows: 

Title  21 – EMERGENCY SERVICES 

CHAPTER I. – IN GENERAL 

Sec. 21-1 (a). – Definitions. 

The following words, terms, and phrases, when used in this article, shall have the meanings 
ascribed to them in this section, except where the context clearly indicates a different meaning: 

Emergency means an occurrence, or threat thereof, that results or may result in substantial injury 
or harm to the population, or substantial damage to or loss of property. An “emergency” may be 
further identified as a “natural emergency,” “technological emergency,” or “manmade emergency” 
as defined in T.C.A. § 58-2-101. 

Emergency declaration means a declaration of local emergency by the City Manager or Mayor, 
pursuant to T.C.A. § 58-8-104(b) and Tennessee Attorney Opinion 11-11, or a declaration of 
emergency or disaster by the Governor of the State of Tennessee or the President of the United 
States. 

Sec. 21-1 (b). – Emergency powers of the city manager. 

(a) General Authority. 
In carrying out emergency management activities, the City shall exercise the powers and 

Page 19 of 253



authorities established in T.C.A. § 58-2-110 in order to provide for the public health, safety, and 
welfare as expeditiously as may be necessary under the circumstances. Such powers may be 
exercised by the City Manager when: 

1. An emergency declaration has been issued; or 
2. No emergency declaration has yet been issued, but the City Manager has, in the City 

Manager’s discretion, determined that an emergency exists requiring immediate action to 
protect life or property. 

(b) Exercise of Powers Requiring Board Approval. 
Certain powers normally requiring approval of the Board of Commissioners in non-emergency 
situations may be exercised by the City Manager during emergencies as provided in this section. 
The Board of Commissioners may establish limits on the amount of emergency expenditure that 
may be authorized by the City Manager. 

When emergency powers are exercised by the City Manager pursuant to this section, the City 
Manager shall provide a written report to the Board of Commissioners detailing the powers 
exercised that otherwise would have required Board approval. The report shall include 
descriptions of any purchases approved and contracts authorized by the City Manager that would 
otherwise require advance approval of the Board. 

Acceptance of such report by the Board of Commissioners shall constitute ratification of any 
such contracts, purchases, or other actions taken by the City Manager. 

(c) Permit Fee Waivers. 
Following an emergency declaration, the City Manager may temporarily waive or reduce 
applicable permit fees normally assessed by the City for repairs or reconstruction work made 
necessary by the occurrence of the emergency. Any such waivers or reductions shall be granted 
uniformly, provided that the repair or reconstruction work is directly related to the qualifying 
emergency. Such waivers or reductions may be granted retroactively to the date of the 
emergency and shall remain in effect for a time period determined by the City Manager. 

(d) Duration of Emergency Powers. 
The powers granted to the City Manager under this section may be exercised for a period of 
ninety (90) days following the date of the emergency, unless extended by the Board of 
Commissioners based upon the scope of the emergency and duration of the recovery period. 

(e) Succession of Authority. 
In the absence or disability of the City Manager, the powers and authority granted under this 
article shall be exercised by the Assistant City Manager. If both the City Manager and Assistant 
City Manager are absent the City Manager will delegate authority to someone else. 

SECTION 2. Severability. 

If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this ordinance is for any reason held to 
be unconstitutional or invalid, such decision shall not affect the remaining portions of this 
ordinance. 

Page 20 of 253



SECTION 3. Repealer. 

All ordinances or parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed to the extent of 
such conflict. 

SECTION 4. Effective Date. 

This Ordinance shall take effect fifteen days from and after its final passage, the public welfare 
requiring it. 

       
MAYOR RUSTY TINNIN     Passed:    
        Passed:    

       
CITY CLERK 
 

APPROVED AS TO LEGALITY AND FORM: 

 

       
CITY ATTORNEY 
 

Page 21 of 253



 

AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET 
Board of Commissioners  

City of Goodlettsville 
 
 

 
SUBJECT TITLE:  Resolution 26-1319 
A resolution of the Board of Commissioners of 
the City of Goodlettsville, Tennessee, to establish 
an Infrastructure Development District relating to 
the residential development, Copper Valley, 
located on Moncrief Avenue and being developed 
by Last of the Loggers, a Limited Liability 
Corporation. 
 
PRESENTED BY:   Tim Ellis, City Manager 
                                
                                
 

 
Agenda Item:  Resolution 26-1319 
 
Dept. of Origin: Administration 
 
For Agenda of:  March 19, 2026 
 
Originator:  Tim Ellis 
 
Cost of Item: Cost is neutral due to revenue 
created. 
 

 
 

AGENDA ITEM ATTACHMENTS: 
Resolution 26-1319 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
A resolution of the Board of Commissioners of the City of Goodlettsville, Tennessee, to establish an 
Infrastructure Development District relating to the residential development, Copper Valley, located on 
Moncrief Avenue and being developed by Last of the Loggers, a Limited Liability Corporation. 
 
FINANCIAL SUMMARY: 
Cost is neutral due to revenue created. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Staff recommends approval of Resolution 26-1319. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 22 of 253



RESOLUTION NO. 26-1319 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF THE CITY OF 
GOODLETTSVILLE, TENNESSEE, TO ESTABLISH AN INFRASTRUCTURE 
DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT RELATING TO THE RESIDENTIAL DEVELOPMENT, 
COPPER VALLEY, LOCATED ON MONCRIEF AVENUE AND BEING DEVELOPED 
BY LAST OF THE LOGGERS A LIMITED LIABILITY CORPORATION. 

WHEREAS, the City of Goodlettsville, Tennessee (the “City”), is authorized pursuant to 
Tennessee law, including but not limited to Tennessee Code Annotated, Title 7, Chapter 84, and 
other applicable provisions of law, to establish infrastructure development districts for the 
purpose of financing and providing public infrastructure improvements; and 

WHEREAS, Last of the Loggers, LLC (the “Developer”), is proposing the development of 
certain real property located on Moncrief Avenue within the corporate limits of the City (the 
“Property”) for residential purposes; and 

WHEREAS, the proposed development of the Property could require certain public 
infrastructure improvements, which may include, but are not limited to, streets, sidewalks, off-
site roadway and turn lane improvements, drainage facilities, water and sewer extensions, 
stormwater improvements, public utilities, and other related public improvements (collectively, 
the “Improvements”); and 

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners has determined that the creation of an Infrastructure 
Development District (“IDD”) encompassing the Property may facilitate the orderly 
development of the Property and provide a mechanism for financing and constructing the 
Improvements in a manner that promotes the public health, safety, and welfare; and 

WHEREAS, the establishment of an IDD would require compliance with all statutory 
requirements, including preparation of a plan of services, notice, public hearing, and adoption of 
an ordinance formally creating such a district. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF 
THE CITY OF GOODLETTSVILLE, TENNESSEE, AS FOLLOWS: 

Section 1. Intent. 
The Board of Commissioners hereby expresses the intent to establish an Infrastructure 
Development District encompassing the Property located on Moncrief Avenue and being 
developed by Last of the Loggers, LLC, for the purpose of financing and constructing public 
infrastructure improvements associated with the proposed residential development. 

Section 2. Authorization to Proceed with Evaluation. 
City staff, in coordination with the Developer and the City Attorney, are authorized to undertake 
the necessary reviews, negotiations, and preparation of documents required by Tennessee law, 
including a proposed plan of services and cost estimates for the Improvements, in order to 

Page 23 of 253



present a formal ordinance and supporting documentation for consideration by the Board of 
Commissioners. 

Section 3. No Obligation Created. 
This Resolution expresses the Board’s intent to establish an Infrastructure Development District 
but does not constitute approval of the district, approval of any financing mechanism, nor create 
any financial obligation of the City. The creation of any such district shall require separate 
approval by ordinance following all required statutory procedures. 

Section 4. Effective Date. 
This Resolution shall take effect immediately upon its adoption, the public welfare requiring it. 

ADOPTED this 19th day of March, 2026. 

       
MAYOR RUSTY TINNIN  
       
       
CITY CLERK 
 

APPROVED AS TO LEGALITY AND FORM: 

 

       
CITY ATTORNEY 
 

 

Page 24 of 253



 

AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET 
Board of Commissioners  

City of Goodlettsville 
 
 

 
SUBJECT TITLE:  Ordinance 26-1136 
An ordinance to amend the official Zoning Map of 
Goodlettsville adopted per Ordinance 15-851 by 
changing the zoning of a property on Springfield 
Highway 41/SR 11 from CPUD, Commercial 
Planned Unit Development Limited to CG, 
Commercial General. FIRST READING 
 
PRESENTED BY:   Tim Ellis, City Manager 
                                
                                
 

 
Agenda Item:  Ordinance 26-1136 
 
Dept. of Origin: Planning 
 
For Agenda of:  March 19, 2026 
 
Originator:  Addam McCormick 
 
Cost of Item: N/A 
 

 
 

AGENDA ITEM ATTACHMENTS: 
Ordinance 26-1136 
Planning Commission March 2026 Review of High Density Properties 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
An ordinance to amend the official Zoning Map of Goodlettsville adopted per Ordinance 15-851 by 
changing the zoning of a property on Springfield Highway 41/SR 11 from CPUD, Commercial Planned 
Unit Development Limited to CG, Commercial General. 
 
FINANCIAL SUMMARY: 
None. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Recommended by the Planning Commission. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 25 of 253



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1136 
 

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE OFFICIAL ZONING MAP OF 
GOODLETTSVILLE ADOPTED PER ORDINANCE 15-851 BY 
CHANGING THE ZONING OF A PROPERTY ON SPRINGFIELD 
HIGHWAY 41/SR 11 FROM CPUD, COMMERCIAL PLANNED 
UNIT DEVELOPMENT AND CPUDL, COMMERCIAL PLANNED 
UNIT DEVELOPMENT LIMITED TO CG, COMMERCIAL 
GENERAL   
 

 
WHEREAS, the City’s Zoning Ordinance intent and purpose includes but is not limited to 
dividing the city into zones and districts restricting and regulating therein the location, 
construction, and use of commercial buildings, structures; and, 

 
WHEREAS, the City’s Zoning Ordinance intent and purpose includes but is not limited to 
protecting the character and maintain the stability of business, commercial within the city, and  

    to promote the orderly and beneficial development of such areas; and,  
 

 
WHEARAS, the City’s Comprehensive Land Use Plan defines the area of Springfield Highway 
north of the Louisville Hwy 31W/SR 41 exchange as Commercial Corridor intended for CG, 
Commercial General zoning; and,  
 
 
WHEREAS, the Goodlettsville Planning Commission has reviewed and discussed this proposed 
amendment and voted on March 2, 2026 to recommend its passage to the Board of 
Commissioners based on the proposal being consistent with the City’s Comprehensive Land Use 
Plan,  
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED AND IT IS HEREBY ORDAINED BY THE 
BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF THE CITY OF GOODLETTSVILLE, TENNESSE, 
AS FOLLOWS: 
 

 SECTION 1.  That the Official Zoning Map adopted by Ordinance No. 15-851 entered 
on second reading on November 12, 2015 being the municipal zoning map of Goodlettsville, 
Tennessee, be and the same is hereby amended as follows: 
 
By changing the property classification to CG, Commercial General for the referenced property 
attached as “EXHIBIT A” and described as follows:  
 
 
THE 7.4 ACRE PROPERTY AT SPRINGFIELD HIGHWAY 41/SR 41 REFERENCED 
AS MAP/PARCEL 141 00801 000 SHOWN IN THE RECORDS OF THE ASSESSOR OF 
PROPERTY OF SUMNER COUNTY, TENNESSEE. 
 
 SECTION 2.  That the Commissioners of the City of Goodlettsville, Tennessee, hereby 
certify that this Ordinance has been submitted to the Planning Commission of the City of 
Goodlettsville for a recommendation, and a notice of hearing thereon has been ordered after at 
least twenty-one (21) days notice of the time and place of said meeting has been published in a 
newspaper circulated in the City of Goodlettsville, Tennessee.  This Ordinance shall take effect 
twenty-one (21) days from the date of its final passage, the public welfare demanding it. 

Page 26 of 253



 
 SECTION 3.  If any section, clause, provision, or portion of this Ordinance is for any 
reason declared invalid or unconstitutional by any court of competent jurisdiction, such holding 
shall not affect any other section, clause, provision or portion of this Ordinance which is not 
itself invalid or unconstitutional. 
 
 SECTION 4.  In case of conflict between this Ordinance or any part thereof and the 
whole or part of any existing or future Ordinance of the City of Goodlettsville, the most 
restrictive shall in all cases apply. 

________________________ 
         MAYOR RUSTY TINNIN 
_________________________ 
CITY RECORDER 
 
APPROVED AS TO LEGALITY AND FORM: 
 
_________________________ 
CITY ATTORNEY 
 

      Passed First Reading: _______________________ 
      Passed Second Reading: _____________________ 
  

Page 27 of 253



 
 
 
 
 

 
 

SUBJECT PROPERTY  
SPRINGFIELD HIGHWAY 41/SR 11  

SUMNER COUNTY TAX MAP/PARCEL# 141 00801 000 
 
 
 

 

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

ORDINANCE 26-1136 
“EXHIBIT A”

E

Page 28 of 253



Property#1  
6.69 Acres- 0 Alta Loma along east side of I-65 south of Rivergate Parkway:  
Property Owners: Brittney and Richard Fisher  
County: Davidson County  
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development.  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts:  
-HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development,  
-CSL, Commercial  
-R25, Low Density Residential  
Surrounding Uses: Townhouses, Apartments, Houses, I-65, Billboard, Cell Tower  
Active Vested Rights: No  
Project Master Plan: No  
Planning Commission Recommendation: Maintain HDRPUD, High Density Residential 
Planned Unit Development 

Property#2  
5.92 Acres- O West Monticello Ave:  
Property Owner: Dr. D.N Singh 
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development.  
County: Davidson County  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts:  
-HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development,  
-R15, Medium Density Residential  
Surrounding Uses: Railroad Tracks, Townhouse, Houses, Nashville State Campus   
Active Vested Rights: No 
Project Master Plan: No  
Planning Commission Recommendation: Maintain HDRPUD, High Density Residential 
Planned Unit Development 

Property# 3 
5.9 -Acres- O Dry Creek Road  
Property Owner: Warren B Properties, LLC. 
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development  
County: Davidson County  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts: 
-HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development 
-R25, Low Density Residential (Draper Drive)  
Surrounding Uses: Apartments, Houses, Townhouses  
Active Vested Rights: No  
Project Master Plan: Original Rivergate Acres master plan 
Planning Commission Recommendation: Maintain HDRPUD, High Density Residential 
Planned Unit Development 
 

Page 29 of 253



Property#4 
Dry Creek Road – 2.54 Acres  
Property Owners: Sam Tinnin and James Simpson  
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development.  
County: Davidson County  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts: 
- HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development. 
-CPUD, Commercial Planned Unit Development  
Surrounding Uses: 
-Apartments and Church Building  
-Active Vested Rights: No  
Project Master Plan: No  
Planning Commission Recommendation: Rezoning to CPUD, Commercial Planned Unit 
Development  
 
 
Property#5 
31.05 Acres- 188 Dry Creek Road  
Intersection of Dry Creek Road/Old Dickerson Road  
Property Owners: Donovan and Edna Grant  
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development.  
County: Davidson County  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts:   
-HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development. 
-LDRPUD, Low Density Residential Planned Unit Development  
-CS, Commercial Services   
-A, Agricultural  
Surrounding Uses:  
-Apartments and Houses  
Active Vested Rights: No  
Project Master Plan: 2003 Dry Creek Farms Master Plan– Seventy-two (72) Condos, Six (6) 
Residential House Lots   
Planning Commission Recommendation: Rezoning to MDRPUD, Medium Density 
Residential Planned Unit Development and Preliminary Master Plan Amendment to 
detached one family dwelling units only  
 

Property#6  
1211 S. Dickerson Road Rear Portion of 6.9 Acres  
Property Owners: Goodlettsville Partners, LLC  
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development.  
County: Davidson County  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts:   
-HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development. 

Page 30 of 253



-LDRPUD, Low Density Residential Planned Unit Development  
-CS, Commercial Services   
-A, Agricultural 
Surrounding Uses: 
-Apartments, Houses, Commercial  
Active Vested Rights: No (Recently Expired in July 2025) 
Project Master Plan: Seventy-five (75) Unit Apartment and Dickerson Road Frontage Area 
Zoned CS, Commercial Services  
Planning Commission Recommendation: Maintain HDRPUD, High Density Residential 
Planned Unit Development 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Page 31 of 253



 

Goodlettsville Zoning Map 

 

    - Light Green/Brown- HRDPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development  

    - Purple- R15, Medium Density Residential  

    - Red- R-25, Low Density Residential  

    - Light Green- Agricultural  

    - Light Blue- CPUD, Commercial Planned Unit Development  

     -Dark Green- LDRPUD, Low Density Residential Planned Unit Development  

 

Comprehensive Land Use Plan Section:  

Residential Neighborhood Preservation 

This district aims to maintain small-town charm into the future by preserving the character of its 
existing neighborhoods to prevent inconsistent infill development and redevelopment in the 
neighborhood. The district seeks to preserve existing residential subdivisions and 
neighborhoods by maintaining average lot sizes and limiting zoning uses in order to 
provide consistent property uses and densities. The district seeks to ensure that the 
development of vacant properties are generally consistent with the density and design of 
adjacent areas. 

Page 32 of 253



 

Page 33 of 253



 

AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET 
Board of Commissioners  

City of Goodlettsville 
 
 

 
SUBJECT TITLE:  Ordinance 26-1137 
An ordinance to amend the official Zoning Map of 
Goodlettsville adopted per Ordinance 15-851 by 
changing the zoning of a property on Dry Creek 
Road from HDRPUD, High Density Residential 
Planned Unit Development to CPUD, Commercial 
Planned Unit Development. FIRST READING 
 
PRESENTED BY:   Tim Ellis, City Manager 
                                
                                
 

 
Agenda Item:  Ordinance 26-1137 
 
Dept. of Origin: Planning 
 
For Agenda of:  March 19, 2026 
 
Originator:  Addam McCormick 
 
Cost of Item: N/A 
 

 
 

AGENDA ITEM ATTACHMENTS: 
Ordinance 26-1137 
Planning Commission March 2026 Review of High Density Properties 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
An ordinance to amend the official Zoning Map of Goodlettsville adopted per Ordinance 15-851 by 
changing the zoning of a property on Dry Creek Road from HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned 
Unit Development to CPUD, Commercial Planned Unit Development. 
 
FINANCIAL SUMMARY: 
None. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Recommended by the Planning Commission. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 34 of 253



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1137 
 

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE OFFICIAL ZONING MAP OF 
GOODLETTSVILLE ADOPTED PER ORDINANCE 15-851 BY 
CHANGING THE ZONING OF A PROPERTY ON DRY CREEK 
ROAD FROM HDRPUD, HIGH DENSITY RESIDENTIAL 
PLANNED UNIT DEVELOPMENT TO CPUD, COMMERCIAL 
PLANNED UNIT DEVELOPMENT  
 

 
WHEREAS, the City’s Zoning Ordinance intent and purpose includes but is not limited to 
dividing the city into zones and districts restricting and regulating therein the location, 
construction, and use of commercial buildings, structures; and, 

 
WHEREAS, the City’s Zoning Ordinance intent and purpose includes but is not limited to 
protecting the character and maintain the stability of business, commercial within the city, and  

    to promote the orderly and beneficial development of such areas; and,  
 

 
WHEARAS, the City’s Comprehensive Land Use Plan defines the area of the property on Dry 
Creek Road as Residential Neighborhood Preservation and the adjacent property is currently zoned   
CPUD, Commercial Planned Unit Development; and,  
 
 
WHEREAS, the Goodlettsville Planning Commission has reviewed and discussed this proposed 
amendment and voted on March 2, 2026 to recommend its passage to the Board of 
Commissioners due to the adjacent property at the intersection of Dickerson Road Hwy 41/SR 11 
being zoned CPUD, Commercial Planned Unit Development; and,  
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED AND IT IS HEREBY ORDAINED BY THE 
BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF THE CITY OF GOODLETTSVILLE, TENNESSE, 
AS FOLLOWS: 
 

 SECTION 1.  That the Official Zoning Map adopted by Ordinance No. 15-851 entered 
on second reading on November 12, 2015 being the municipal zoning map of Goodlettsville, 
Tennessee, be and the same is hereby amended as follows: 
 
By changing the property classification to CPUD, Commercial Planned Unit Development 
Commercial for the referenced property attached as “EXHIBIT A” and described as follows:  
 
 
THE 2.54 ACRE PROPERTY AT DRY CREEK ROAD REFERENCED AS 
MAP/PARCEL 03300020400 IN THE RECORDS OF THE ASSESSOR OF PROPERTY 
OF DAVIDSON COUNTY, TENNESSEE. 
 
 SECTION 2.  That the Commissioners of the City of Goodlettsville, Tennessee, hereby 
certify that this Ordinance has been submitted to the Planning Commission of the City of 
Goodlettsville for a recommendation, and a notice of hearing thereon has been ordered after at 
least twenty-one (21) days notice of the time and place of said meeting has been published in a 
newspaper circulated in the City of Goodlettsville, Tennessee.  This Ordinance shall take effect 
twenty-one (21) days from the date of its final passage, the public welfare demanding it. 
 

Page 35 of 253



 SECTION 3.  If any section, clause, provision, or portion of this Ordinance is for any 
reason declared invalid or unconstitutional by any court of competent jurisdiction, such holding 
shall not affect any other section, clause, provision or portion of this Ordinance which is not 
itself invalid or unconstitutional. 
 
 SECTION 4.  In case of conflict between this Ordinance or any part thereof and the 
whole or part of any existing or future Ordinance of the City of Goodlettsville, the most 
restrictive shall in all cases apply. 

________________________ 
         MAYOR 
_________________________ 
CITY RECORDER 
 
APPROVED AS TO LEGALITY AND FORM: 
 
_________________________ 
CITY ATTORNEY 
 

      Passed First Reading: _______________________ 
      Passed Second Reading: _____________________ 
  

Page 36 of 253



 
 
 
 
 

 
 

SUBJECT PROPERTY  
DRY CREEK ROAD  

DAVIDSON COUNTY TAX MAP/PARCEL# 03300020400 
 
 
 

 

 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

ORDINANCE 26-1137 
“EXHIBIT A”

E

Page 37 of 253



Property#1  
6.69 Acres- 0 Alta Loma along east side of I-65 south of Rivergate Parkway:  
Property Owners: Brittney and Richard Fisher  
County: Davidson County  
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development.  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts:  
-HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development,  
-CSL, Commercial  
-R25, Low Density Residential  
Surrounding Uses: Townhouses, Apartments, Houses, I-65, Billboard, Cell Tower  
Active Vested Rights: No  
Project Master Plan: No  
Planning Commission Recommendation: Maintain HDRPUD, High Density Residential 
Planned Unit Development 

Property#2  
5.92 Acres- O West Monticello Ave:  
Property Owner: Dr. D.N Singh 
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development.  
County: Davidson County  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts:  
-HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development,  
-R15, Medium Density Residential  
Surrounding Uses: Railroad Tracks, Townhouse, Houses, Nashville State Campus   
Active Vested Rights: No 
Project Master Plan: No  
Planning Commission Recommendation: Maintain HDRPUD, High Density Residential 
Planned Unit Development 

Property# 3 
5.9 -Acres- O Dry Creek Road  
Property Owner: Warren B Properties, LLC. 
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development  
County: Davidson County  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts: 
-HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development 
-R25, Low Density Residential (Draper Drive)  
Surrounding Uses: Apartments, Houses, Townhouses  
Active Vested Rights: No  
Project Master Plan: Original Rivergate Acres master plan 
Planning Commission Recommendation: Maintain HDRPUD, High Density Residential 
Planned Unit Development 
 

Page 38 of 253



Property#4 
Dry Creek Road – 2.54 Acres  
Property Owners: Sam Tinnin and James Simpson  
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development.  
County: Davidson County  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts: 
- HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development. 
-CPUD, Commercial Planned Unit Development  
Surrounding Uses: 
-Apartments and Church Building  
-Active Vested Rights: No  
Project Master Plan: No  
Planning Commission Recommendation: Rezoning to CPUD, Commercial Planned Unit 
Development  
 
 
Property#5 
31.05 Acres- 188 Dry Creek Road  
Intersection of Dry Creek Road/Old Dickerson Road  
Property Owners: Donovan and Edna Grant  
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development.  
County: Davidson County  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts:   
-HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development. 
-LDRPUD, Low Density Residential Planned Unit Development  
-CS, Commercial Services   
-A, Agricultural  
Surrounding Uses:  
-Apartments and Houses  
Active Vested Rights: No  
Project Master Plan: 2003 Dry Creek Farms Master Plan– Seventy-two (72) Condos, Six (6) 
Residential House Lots   
Planning Commission Recommendation: Rezoning to MDRPUD, Medium Density 
Residential Planned Unit Development and Preliminary Master Plan Amendment to 
detached one family dwelling units only  
 

Property#6  
1211 S. Dickerson Road Rear Portion of 6.9 Acres  
Property Owners: Goodlettsville Partners, LLC  
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development.  
County: Davidson County  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts:   
-HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development. 

Page 39 of 253



-LDRPUD, Low Density Residential Planned Unit Development  
-CS, Commercial Services   
-A, Agricultural 
Surrounding Uses: 
-Apartments, Houses, Commercial  
Active Vested Rights: No (Recently Expired in July 2025) 
Project Master Plan: Seventy-five (75) Unit Apartment and Dickerson Road Frontage Area 
Zoned CS, Commercial Services  
Planning Commission Recommendation: Maintain HDRPUD, High Density Residential 
Planned Unit Development 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Page 40 of 253



 

Goodlettsville Zoning Map 

 

    - Light Green/Brown- HRDPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development  

    - Purple- R15, Medium Density Residential  

    - Red- R-25, Low Density Residential  

    - Light Green- Agricultural  

    - Light Blue- CPUD, Commercial Planned Unit Development  

     -Dark Green- LDRPUD, Low Density Residential Planned Unit Development  

 

Comprehensive Land Use Plan Section:  

Residential Neighborhood Preservation 

This district aims to maintain small-town charm into the future by preserving the character of its 
existing neighborhoods to prevent inconsistent infill development and redevelopment in the 
neighborhood. The district seeks to preserve existing residential subdivisions and 
neighborhoods by maintaining average lot sizes and limiting zoning uses in order to 
provide consistent property uses and densities. The district seeks to ensure that the 
development of vacant properties are generally consistent with the density and design of 
adjacent areas. 

Page 41 of 253



 

Page 42 of 253



 

AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET 
Board of Commissioners  

City of Goodlettsville 
 
 

 
SUBJECT TITLE:  Ordinance 26-1138 
An ordinance to amend the official Zoning Map of 
Goodlettsville adopted per Ordinance 15-851 by 
changing the zoning of a property on Dry Creek 
Road and Old Dickerson Road from HDRPUD, 
High Density Residential Planned Unit 
Development and Dry Creek Farms Master Plan 
amendment. FIRST READING 
 
PRESENTED BY:   Tim Ellis, City Manager 
                                
                                
 

 
Agenda Item:  Ordinance 26-1138 
 
Dept. of Origin: Planning 
 
For Agenda of:  March 19, 2026 
 
Originator:  Addam McCormick 
 
Cost of Item: N/A 
 

 
 

AGENDA ITEM ATTACHMENTS: 
Ordinance 26-1138 
Planning Commission March 2026 Review of High Density Properties 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
An ordinance to amend the official Zoning Map of Goodlettsville adopted per Ordinance 15-851 by 
changing the zoning of a property on Dry Creek Road and Old Dickerson Road from HDRPUD, High 
Density Residential Planned Unit Development and Dry Creek Farms Master Plan amendment. 
 
FINANCIAL SUMMARY: 
None. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Recommended by the Planning Commission. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 43 of 253



ORDINANCE NO. 26-1138 
 

AN ORDINANCE TO AMEND THE OFFICIAL ZONING MAP OF 
GOODLETTSVILLE ADOPTED PER ORDINANCE 15-851 BY 
CHANGING THE ZONING OF A PROPERTY ON DRY CREEK 
ROAD AND OLD DICKERSON ROAD FROM HDRPUD, HIGH 
DENSITY RESIDENTIAL PLANNED UNIT DEVELOPMENT TO 
MDRPUD, MEDIUM DENSITY RESIDENTIAL PLANNED UNIT 
DEVELOPMENT AND DRY CREEK FARMS MASTER PLAN 
AMENDMENT  
 

 
WHEREAS, the City’s Zoning Ordinance intent and purpose includes but is not limited to 
permitting development of land, which by reason of topography or floodable land contains 
some areas unsuitable for development and to permit the clustering of lots in order to leave the 
unsuitable land as permanent open space. The preservation of land in open space for amenity 
value, recreation, wildlife habitat or forest protection is also a suitable purpose for planned unit 
development zoning; and,  

 
WHEREAS, the City’s Zoning Ordinance intent and purpose includes but is not limited to 
protecting the character and maintaining the stability of residential areas within the city, and to 
promote the orderly and beneficial development of such area; and,  

 
 
WHEARAS, the City’s Comprehensive Land Use Plan defines the area of the property on Dry 
Creek Road and Old Dickerson Road as Residential Neighborhood Preservation with adjacent low 
and high density residential zonings and developments including apartments, townhouses, and one 
family detached dwelling units (houses); and,  
 
 
WHEREAS, the Goodlettsville Planning Commission has reviewed and discussed this proposed 
amendment and voted on March 2, 2026 to recommend its passage to the Board of 
Commissioners due to the adjacent property uses and zoning designations and intention for one 
family detached dwelling unit developments.  
 
NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED AND IT IS HEREBY ORDAINED BY THE 
BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF THE CITY OF GOODLETTSVILLE, TENNESSE, 
AS FOLLOWS: 
 

 SECTION 1.  That the Official Zoning Map adopted by Ordinance No. 15-851 entered 
on second reading on November 12, 2015 being the municipal zoning map of Goodlettsville, 
Tennessee, be and the same is hereby amended as follows: 
 
By changing the property classification to MDRPUD, Medium Density Residential Planned Unit 
Development for the referenced property attached as “EXHIBIT A” and described as follows and 
amendment of the Dry Creek Farms master plan to change the defined property area from 
seventy-two (72) multi-family units and six (6) one family detached dwelling units to one family 
detached dwelling units only per the MDRPUD, Medium Density Residential Planned Unit 
Development Zoning Ordinance provisions.  
 

Page 44 of 253



 
THE 31.05 ACRE PROPERTY AT 188 DRY CREEK ROAD REFERENCED AS 
MAP/PARCEL 03300002100 IN THE RECORDS OF THE ASSESSOR OF PROPERTY 
OF DAVIDSON COUNTY, TENNESSEE. 
 
 SECTION 2.  That the Commissioners of the City of Goodlettsville, Tennessee, hereby 
certify that this Ordinance has been submitted to the Planning Commission of the City of 
Goodlettsville for a recommendation, and a notice of hearing thereon has been ordered after at 
least twenty-one (21) days notice of the time and place of said meeting has been published in a 
newspaper circulated in the City of Goodlettsville, Tennessee.  This Ordinance shall take effect 
twenty-one (21) days from the date of its final passage, the public welfare demanding it. 
 
 SECTION 3.  If any section, clause, provision, or portion of this Ordinance is for any 
reason declared invalid or unconstitutional by any court of competent jurisdiction, such holding 
shall not affect any other section, clause, provision or portion of this Ordinance which is not 
itself invalid or unconstitutional. 
 
 SECTION 4.  In case of conflict between this Ordinance or any part thereof and the 
whole or part of any existing or future Ordinance of the City of Goodlettsville, the most 
restrictive shall in all cases apply. 

_______________________ 
         MAYOR RUSTY TINNIN 
_________________________ 
CITY RECORDER 
 
APPROVED AS TO LEGALITY AND FORM: 
 
_________________________ 
CITY ATTORNEY 
 

      Passed First Reading: _______________________ 
      Passed Second Reading: _____________________ 
  

Page 45 of 253



 
 
 
 
 
 

SUBJECT PROPERTY  
188 DRY CREEK ROAD/ OLD DICKERSON ROAD 

DAVIDSON COUNTY TAX MAP/PARCEL# 03300002100 
 
 

 
 
 

 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

ORDINANCE 26-1138 
“EXHIBIT A”

E

Page 46 of 253



 
 

Dry Creek Farms Master Plan Amendment  
Areas C and D revise to permit one family detached dwellings units only per the MDRPUD, 

Medium Density Residential Planned Unit Development provisions of the Zoning 
Ordinance  

 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 47 of 253



Property#1  
6.69 Acres- 0 Alta Loma along east side of I-65 south of Rivergate Parkway:  
Property Owners: Brittney and Richard Fisher  
County: Davidson County  
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development.  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts:  
-HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development,  
-CSL, Commercial  
-R25, Low Density Residential  
Surrounding Uses: Townhouses, Apartments, Houses, I-65, Billboard, Cell Tower  
Active Vested Rights: No  
Project Master Plan: No  
Planning Commission Recommendation: Maintain HDRPUD, High Density Residential 
Planned Unit Development 

Property#2  
5.92 Acres- O West Monticello Ave:  
Property Owner: Dr. D.N Singh 
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development.  
County: Davidson County  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts:  
-HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development,  
-R15, Medium Density Residential  
Surrounding Uses: Railroad Tracks, Townhouse, Houses, Nashville State Campus   
Active Vested Rights: No 
Project Master Plan: No  
Planning Commission Recommendation: Maintain HDRPUD, High Density Residential 
Planned Unit Development 

Property# 3 
5.9 -Acres- O Dry Creek Road  
Property Owner: Warren B Properties, LLC. 
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development  
County: Davidson County  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts: 
-HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development 
-R25, Low Density Residential (Draper Drive)  
Surrounding Uses: Apartments, Houses, Townhouses  
Active Vested Rights: No  
Project Master Plan: Original Rivergate Acres master plan 
Planning Commission Recommendation: Maintain HDRPUD, High Density Residential 
Planned Unit Development 
 

Page 48 of 253



Property#4 
Dry Creek Road – 2.54 Acres  
Property Owners: Sam Tinnin and James Simpson  
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development.  
County: Davidson County  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts: 
- HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development. 
-CPUD, Commercial Planned Unit Development  
Surrounding Uses: 
-Apartments and Church Building  
-Active Vested Rights: No  
Project Master Plan: No  
Planning Commission Recommendation: Rezoning to CPUD, Commercial Planned Unit 
Development  
 
 
Property#5 
31.05 Acres- 188 Dry Creek Road  
Intersection of Dry Creek Road/Old Dickerson Road  
Property Owners: Donovan and Edna Grant  
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development.  
County: Davidson County  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts:   
-HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development. 
-LDRPUD, Low Density Residential Planned Unit Development  
-CS, Commercial Services   
-A, Agricultural  
Surrounding Uses:  
-Apartments and Houses  
Active Vested Rights: No  
Project Master Plan: 2003 Dry Creek Farms Master Plan– Seventy-two (72) Condos, Six (6) 
Residential House Lots   
Planning Commission Recommendation: Rezoning to MDRPUD, Medium Density 
Residential Planned Unit Development and Preliminary Master Plan Amendment to 
detached one family dwelling units only  
 

Property#6  
1211 S. Dickerson Road Rear Portion of 6.9 Acres  
Property Owners: Goodlettsville Partners, LLC  
Property Zoning: HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development.  
County: Davidson County  
Comprehensive Land Use Plan Designation: Residential Neighborhood Preservation 
Surrounding Zoning Districts:   
-HDRPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development. 

Page 49 of 253



-LDRPUD, Low Density Residential Planned Unit Development  
-CS, Commercial Services   
-A, Agricultural 
Surrounding Uses: 
-Apartments, Houses, Commercial  
Active Vested Rights: No (Recently Expired in July 2025) 
Project Master Plan: Seventy-five (75) Unit Apartment and Dickerson Road Frontage Area 
Zoned CS, Commercial Services  
Planning Commission Recommendation: Maintain HDRPUD, High Density Residential 
Planned Unit Development 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Page 50 of 253



 

Goodlettsville Zoning Map 

 

    - Light Green/Brown- HRDPUD, High Density Residential Planned Unit Development  

    - Purple- R15, Medium Density Residential  

    - Red- R-25, Low Density Residential  

    - Light Green- Agricultural  

    - Light Blue- CPUD, Commercial Planned Unit Development  

     -Dark Green- LDRPUD, Low Density Residential Planned Unit Development  

 

Comprehensive Land Use Plan Section:  

Residential Neighborhood Preservation 

This district aims to maintain small-town charm into the future by preserving the character of its 
existing neighborhoods to prevent inconsistent infill development and redevelopment in the 
neighborhood. The district seeks to preserve existing residential subdivisions and 
neighborhoods by maintaining average lot sizes and limiting zoning uses in order to 
provide consistent property uses and densities. The district seeks to ensure that the 
development of vacant properties are generally consistent with the density and design of 
adjacent areas. 

Page 51 of 253



 

Page 52 of 253



 

AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET 
Board of Commissioners  

City of Goodlettsville 
 
 

 
SUBJECT TITLE:  ORDINANCE 26-1139 
An ordinance of the City of Goodlettsville, 
Tennessee amending the fiscal year 2025-2026 
budget, passed by Ordinance 25-1112.  
FIRST READING 
 
PRESENTED BY:   Tim Ellis, City Manager 
                                
 

 
Agenda Item:  Ordinance 26-1139 
 
Dept. of Origin:  Administration  
 
For Agenda of:  March 19, 2026 
 
Originator:  Julie High 
 
Cost of Item: Outlined in Ordinance 
 

 
 

AGENDA ITEM ATTACHMENTS: 
Ordinance 26-1139 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
An ordinance of the City of Goodlettsville, Tennessee amending the fiscal year 2025-2026 budget, 
passed by Ordinance 25-1112. 
 
FINANCIAL SUMMARY: 
Proposed budget amendment outlined in Ordinance below. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Staff recommends approval of Ordinance 26-1139. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Page 53 of 253



 ORDINANCE NO. 26-1139 
 

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF GOODLETTSVILLE, TENNESSEE AMENDING THE FISCAL YEAR 
2025-2026 BUDGET, PASSED BY ORDINANCE #25-1112  
 
WHEREAS, the City of Goodlettsville adopted the fiscal year 2025-2026 budget by passage of Ordinance #25-1112 on 
June 12, 2025; and  
 
WHEREAS, a codes enforcement vehicle sustained minor damage in an accident; and repairs were necessary; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners approved the purchase and installation of 2 tornado sirens after the approval of 
the FY 2025-2026 budget; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners authorized a “Branding Initiative”, and estimated costs for consulting and 
initial rollout of new logo are $125,000, being funded by an ARPA Tourism Grant; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners approved the opening of PG Pool for the 2026 season, which had not been 
included in the FY 2026 Budget; and  
 
WHEREAS, the City received insurance proceeds to replace the traffic signal at Rivergate Parkway and South Main 
Street that was destroyed in an automobile accident; and 
 
WHEREAS, overtime pay in the fire department was under budgeted due to unplanned medical and military absences, 
citizen CPR classes, and Citizens Fire Academy; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners approved the purchase of stream credits to satisfy a portion of its mitigation 
obligation related to permits for City stream work; and 
 
WHEREAS, the Police Department was awarded a Tennessee Highway Safety Officers Grant which is being used for 
DUI interdiction; and 
 
WHEREAS, preliminary design work is necessary for the transportation project at Moss-Wright Park; and 
 
WHEREAS, the City has received a TDTD (Tennessee Department of Tourist Development) Grant in the amount of 
$30,000 to be used for marketing efforts; and 

WHEREAS, the City has received a TN250 Grant for $20,000 which will be used to enhance historical displays in the 
Visitor’s Center; and 

WHEREAS, pursuant to the Tennessee state constitution, Section 24 of Article II, no public money shall be expended 
except pursuant to appropriations made by law. 
 
NOW THEREFORE BE IT ORDAINED BY THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF THE CITY OF 
GOODLETTSVILLE, TENNESSEE THAT CHANGES BE MADE TO THE FISCAL YEAR 2025-2026 BUDGET 
AS FOLLOWS:  
 
Community Development Vehicle Maintenance (Increase) $  4,500 
Insurance Proceeds (Increase)       ($ 3,000) 
General Fund Unassigned Fund Balance (Decrease) (Deductible)   ($ 1,500) 
 
Fire Capital Expenditures (Increase) (Tornado Sirens)  $87,774 
General Fund Unassigned Fund Balance (Decrease)    ($87,774) 
 
 
Tourism Marketing Expenditures (Increase)   $125,000 
Tourism assigned fund balance-ARPA (Decrease) (Grant)    ($125,000) 

Page 54 of 253



 
Pool Salaries (Increase)     $30,000 
Pool Taxes        (Increase)     $  5,000 
Pool Maintenance (Increase)    $14,000 
General Fund Unassigned Fund Balance (Decrease)    ($49,000) 
 
Public Works Street and Traffic Lights (Increase)  $50,000 
Insurance Proceeds (Increase)       ($50,000) 
 
Fire Overtime (Increase)     $  80,000 
Fire FICA (Increase)      $    6,200 
Fire Retirement Benefits (Increase)    $  12,800 
General Fund Unassigned Fund Balance (Decrease)    ($99,000) 
 
Stormwater Capital (Increase) (Stream Bank Credits)  $450,800 
Stormwater Fund Balance (Decrease)      ($450,800) 
 
Police Overtime  (Increase) (Governors Highway Safety)  $30,000 
Grant Revenue (Increase)       ($30,000) 
 
Capital Projects Fund-MWP Transportation Project (Increase) 
(Grant)        $55,000 
Capital Projects Unassigned Fund Balance (Decrease)    $(55,000) 
 
Tourism Marketing Expenditures (Increase)   $30,000 
Tourism Grant Revenue (Increase)      ($30,000) 
 
Tourism Maintenance Expenditures (Increase)   $20,000 
Tourism Grant Revenue (Increase)      ($20,000) 
 
 
THIS ORDINANCE SHALL TAKE EFFECT FIFTEEN DAYS AFTER ITS FINAL ADOPTION, THE 
WELFARE OF THE CITIZENS OF GOODLETTSVILLE REQUIRING IT.  
 
 
_________________________                                         Passed first reading:       
Mayor Rusty Tinnin                                                                                                                                          
 
_________________________                                         Passed second reading:    
City Recorder                                                                                                                              
Approved as to form and legality. 
 
_________________________ 
City Attorney 

Page 55 of 253



 

AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET 
Board of Commissioners  

City of Goodlettsville 
 
 

 
SUBJECT TITLE:  Resolution 26-1322 
A resolution of the Board of Commissioners of 
the City of Goodlettsville expressing opposition to 
Tennessee Senate Bill 2311 and Tennessee House 
Bill 2419 regarding county approval of municipal 
annexations within established Urban Growth 
Boundaries. 
 
PRESENTED BY:   Tim Ellis, City Manager 
                                
                                
 

 
Agenda Item:  Resolution 26-1322 
 
Dept. of Origin: Administration 
 
For Agenda of:  March 19, 2026 
 
Originator:  Tim Ellis 
 
Cost of Item: N/A 
 

 
 

AGENDA ITEM ATTACHMENTS: 
Resolution 26-1322 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
A resolution of the Board of Commissioners of the City of Goodlettsville expressing opposition to 
Tennessee Senate Bill 2311 and Tennessee House Bill 2419 regarding county approval of municipal 
annexations within established Urban Growth Boundaries. 
 
FINANCIAL SUMMARY: 
None. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Staff recommends approval of Resolution 26-1322. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 56 of 253



RESOLUTION NO. 26-1322 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF THE CITY OF 
GOODLETTSVILLE EXPRESSING OPPOSITION TO TENNESSEE SENATE BILL 
2311 AND TENNESSEE HOUSE BILL 2419 REGARDING COUNTY APPROVAL OF 
MUNICIPAL ANNEXATIONS WITHIN ESTABLISHED URBAN GROWTH 
BOUNDARIES 

WHEREAS, the City of Goodlettsville is a municipal corporation organized and existing under 
the laws of the State of Tennessee and is committed to responsible growth, strategic planning, 
and the efficient delivery of municipal services; and 

WHEREAS, pursuant to state law, counties and municipalities have previously engaged in a 
collaborative and deliberative process to establish Urban Growth Boundaries (UGBs), 
representing mutually agreed-upon areas for future municipal annexation and service delivery; 
and 

WHEREAS, these Urban Growth Boundaries were adopted to promote orderly development, 
reduce conflicts between jurisdictions, ensure coordinated infrastructure planning, and provide 
predictability for property owners and residents; and 

WHEREAS, Senate Bill 2311 and House Bill 2419 propose to require approval by the county 
legislative body for municipal annexations, including annexations within already established and 
mutually agreed-upon Urban Growth Boundaries; and 

WHEREAS, imposing an additional layer of county approval within established UGBs 
undermines the integrity of prior intergovernmental agreements and disrupts the statutory 
framework designed to provide clarity and certainty in growth planning; and 

WHEREAS, municipalities are best positioned to evaluate annexation proposals within their 
designated growth areas, including considerations related to infrastructure capacity, public safety 
services, land use planning, and long-term fiscal sustainability; and 

WHEREAS, the proposed legislation may create unnecessary delays, increase 
intergovernmental conflict, discourage economic development, and create uncertainty for 
property owners and developers; and 

WHEREAS, preserving the validity and reliability of established Urban Growth Boundaries is 
essential to maintaining effective long-range planning and protecting the collaborative intent of 
the original growth boundary agreements. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Commissioners of the City of 
Goodlettsville that: 

1. The Board hereby formally expresses its opposition to Tennessee Senate Bill 2311 and 
Tennessee House Bill 2419, which would require county legislative body approval for 

Page 57 of 253



municipal annexations, including those located within previously established Urban 
Growth Boundaries. 

2. The Board affirms its support for maintaining the integrity of existing Urban Growth 
Boundaries and respecting the intergovernmental agreements and statutory processes 
through which they were created. 

3. The Board urges the Tennessee General Assembly to preserve municipal planning 
authority within designated growth areas and to reject legislation that would undermine 
established growth frameworks. 

4. The City Manager is authorized and directed to transmit copies of this Resolution to the 
City’s legislative delegation, the Governor of Tennessee, and other appropriate state 
officials. 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that this Resolution shall take effect immediately upon its 
adoption, the public welfare requiring it. 

_________________________   Adopted: March 19, 2026 
MAYOR RUSTY TINNIN 
 
          
________________________ 
CITY RECORDER 
 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY 

_________________________ 
CITY ATTORNEY 
 

Page 58 of 253



 

AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET 
Board of Commissioners  

City of Goodlettsville 
 
 

 
SUBJECT TITLE:  Resolution 26-1323 
A resolution of the Board of Commissioners of 
the City of Goodlettsville expressing opposition to 
Tennessee Senate Bill 2064 and Tennessee House 
Bill 1873 relating to the imposition of a property 
tax cap on local governments. 
 
PRESENTED BY:   Tim Ellis, City Manager 
                                
                                
 

 
Agenda Item:  Resolution 26-1323 
 
Dept. of Origin: Administration 
 
For Agenda of:  March 19, 2026 
 
Originator:  Tim Ellis 
 
Cost of Item: N/A 
 

 
 

AGENDA ITEM ATTACHMENTS: 
Resolution 26-1323 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
A resolution of the Board of Commissioners of the City of Goodlettsville expressing opposition to 
Tennessee Senate Bill 2064 and Tennessee House Bill 1873 relating to the imposition of a property tax 
cap on local governments. 
 
FINANCIAL SUMMARY: 
None. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Staff recommends approval of Resolution 26-1323. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 59 of 253



RESOLUTION NO. 26-1323 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF THE CITY OF 
GOODLETTSVILLE EXPRESSING OPPOSITION TO TENNESSEE SENATE BILL 
2064 AND TENNESSEE HOUSE BILL 1873 RELATING TO THE IMPOSITION OF A 
PROPERTY TAX CAP ON LOCAL GOVERNMENTS. 

WHEREAS, the City of Goodlettsville is a municipal corporation organized and existing under 
the laws of the State of Tennessee and is charged with providing essential public services to its 
residents, including but not limited to public safety, fire protection, public works, infrastructure 
maintenance, planning and zoning, parks and recreation, and administrative services; and 

WHEREAS, Senate Bill 2064 and House Bill 1873 propose to enact statutory limitations on the 
ability of local governments to adjust property tax rates, effectively imposing a property tax cap; 
and 

WHEREAS, property tax is the primary and most stable source of revenue available to 
municipalities in Tennessee to fund essential public services and to meet the needs of growing 
communities; and 

WHEREAS, local elected officials are directly accountable to the citizens they serve and are in 
the best position to evaluate community needs, fiscal conditions, infrastructure demands, and 
public safety requirements; and 

WHEREAS, the imposition of a state-mandated property tax cap would significantly restrict 
local control, reduce fiscal flexibility, and may impair the City’s ability to respond to 
emergencies, economic fluctuations, inflationary pressures, infrastructure investment needs, and 
state or federally mandated requirements; and 

WHEREAS, such legislation may create unintended consequences, including deferred 
maintenance, reduced service levels, diminished public safety resources, and constraints on long-
term financial planning; and 

WHEREAS, preserving local decision-making authority is essential to maintaining responsible 
governance and ensuring that municipal officials can act in the best interest of their residents. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Commissioners of the City of 
Goodlettsville that: 

1. The Board hereby formally expresses its opposition to Tennessee Senate Bill 2064 and 
Tennessee House Bill 1873, which seek to impose a property tax cap on local 
governments. 

2. The Board affirms its support for local fiscal autonomy and the principle that decisions 
regarding municipal property tax rates should remain under the authority of locally 
elected officials who are accountable to the citizens of their community. 

Page 60 of 253



3. The Board respectfully urges members of the Tennessee General Assembly to reject 
legislation that would limit the City’s ability to responsibly fund essential services and 
meet the evolving needs of its residents. 

4. The City Manager is authorized and directed to transmit copies of this Resolution to the 
City’s legislative delegation, the Governor of Tennessee, and appropriate state officials. 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that this Resolution shall take effect immediately upon its 
adoption, the public welfare requiring it. 

 

_________________________   Adopted:  March 19, 2026 
MAYOR RUSTY TINNIN 
 
          
________________________ 
CITY RECORDER 
 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY 

_________________________ 
CITY ATTORNEY 
 

Page 61 of 253



 

AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET 
Board of Commissioners  

City of Goodlettsville 
 
 

 
SUBJECT TITLE:  Resolution 26-1324 
A resolution of the City of Goodlettsville, 
Tennessee Board of Commissioners establishing a 
policy allowing governing body members to 
participate in meetings by electronic means 
under specific circumstances. 
 
PRESENTED BY:   Tim Ellis, City Manager 
                                
                                
 

 
Agenda Item:  Resolution 26-1324 
 
Dept. of Origin: Administration 
 
For Agenda of:  March 19, 2026 
 
Originator:  Tim Ellis 
 
Cost of Item: N/A 
 

 
 

AGENDA ITEM ATTACHMENTS: 
Resolution 26-1324 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
A resolution of the City of Goodlettsville, Tennessee Board of Commissioners establishing a policy 
allowing governing body members to participate in meetings by electronic means under specific 
circumstances. 
 
FINANCIAL SUMMARY: 
None. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Staff recommends approval of Resolution 26-1324. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 62 of 253



RESOLUTION NO. 26-1324 

 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF GOODLETTSVILLE, TENNESSEE, BOARD OF 

COMMISSIONERS ESTABLISHING A POLICY ALLOWING GOVERNING BODY 

MEMBERS TO PARTICIPATE IN MEETINGS BY ELECTRONIC MEANS UNDER 

SPECIFIC CIRCUMSTANCES.  

 

WHEREAS, Public Chapter 411, Acts of 2025, was passed by the Tennessee General Assembly 

during the 2025 legislative session and signed by Governor Lee on May 9, 2025; and 

 

WHEREAS, the governing body wishes to allow electronic participation in meetings under 

specified circumstances; 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Commissioners of the City of 

Goodlettsville, Tennessee that: 

 

SECTION 1. Participation in Electronic Meetings by Officials.  (1) Pursuant to 

Tennessee Code Annotated § 6-54-149 having adopted this section of law by a two-thirds (2/3) 

majority vote, a member of the Board of Commissioners (hereinafter “governing body”) may 

participate in a scheduled governing body meeting by electronic means, including, but not limited 

to, videoconferencing or other web-based media, but only for the following reasons: 

(a.) The member of the governing body is dealing with a family or medical emergency as 

defined by this resolution;  

(b.) The member of the governing body has been called into military service; or 

(c.) The member of the governing body is unable to attend a meeting due to inclement 

weather. 

(2)  Definitions.  The following terms are defined for the purposes of this resolution as: 

(a.) “Family” is defined as the governing body member’s spouse, parent(s), stepparent(s), 

grandparent(s), sibling(s), child(ren), stepchild(ren), foster child(ren), or 

grandchild(ren). 

(b.) “Family emergency” is defined as an unexpected and serious situation, including a 

medical emergency, involving a family member that requires immediate attention. 

(c.) “Medical emergency” is defined as birth and care of the member’s newborn child, 

placement with the member of a child for adoption or foster care, and a serious health 

condition that involves an illness, injury, impairment, or physical or mental condition 

which requires: 

 

(i.) Overnight hospitalization (including prenatal care), including the period of 

incapacity or subsequent treatment in connection with the overnight care; or 

(ii.) Continuing treatment (for a chronic or long-term condition) under the care or 

supervision of a health care provider. Included under this heading are chronic 

conditions (e.g., asthma, epilepsy, etc.) that continue over an extended period 

of time and may cause episodic rather than a continuing period of incapacity 

and conditions that are not usually incapacitating but would result in a period 

of incapacity of more than 3 consecutive calendar days if medical treatment 

were omitted (e.g., chemotherapy, kidney dialysis, pregnancy, etc.). Note that 

Page 63 of 253



incapacity means the inability to work, attend school, or perform regular daily 

activities (eating, washing, walking, shopping, etc.,) because of a serious health 

condition or treatment for or recovery from a serious health condition. 

 

(d.) “Inclement weather” is defined as any kind of extreme weather, usually snow, ice, or 

flooding, which might create hazardous driving conditions or significantly impair the 

normal operations of the municipality, as declared by the City Manager. 

 

SECTION 2. Member Requirements to Participate Electronically. Any member who 

is absent shall only participate in a meeting through electronic means if the member meets the 

following requirements: 

(1) The member must be visually identified by the mayor, or in their absence, the vice-

mayor or other chairman of the meeting, as required by Tennessee Code Annotated § 

6-54-149. 

(2) The member shall notify the city recorder by 5:00 p.m. the day prior to the meeting of 

the member’s intent to participate electronically.  The member shall state in the notice 

to the city recorder that the member has a family emergency, medical emergency, 

military service, and/or inclement weather condition qualifying the member for 

electronic participation. 

(3) The member shall have the ability to log into the virtual meeting platform using their 

own computer equipment. In order to speak, the member shall use their computer’s 

microphone, a headset, or a phone for sound. 

(4) The member shall keep their microphones muted unless they are actively speaking. 

(5) During the calling of the roll, the member shall unmute their microphone and announce 

their name as an electronic participant.  The city/town recorder shall record this person 

as present for voting purposes, but not for quorum purposes. 

 

SECTION 3. In-person Quorum. The legislative body shall not conduct a meeting that 

includes electronic participation unless a quorum of the governing body is present at the physical 

location of the meeting. No more than 20% of the total membership may participate electronically 

in each meeting.   

 

SECTION 4. Annual Limitation. A member of the governing body shall not participate 

electronically in meetings more than two (2) times per year. 

 

SECTION 5. Public Access. (1) All meetings of the governing body conducted by 

electronic means under this section must remain open and accessible to the public by providing 

real-time, live audio or video access to the public. 

(2) A clear audio or video recording of the meeting shall be made available to the public 

as soon as practicable following the meeting, and in no event more than two (2) business days after 

the meeting. 

 

SECTION 6. Public Notice. In the public notice required by the Tennessee Code 

Annotated § 8-44-103, the governing body shall provide information regarding how the public can 

obtain real-time, live access to, or a broadcast of, the meeting, and the governing body shall provide 

an agenda for the meeting in such notice. 

Page 64 of 253



 

SECTION 7. Staff Facilitation of Electronic Access. Upon notice of electronic 

participation by a member of the governing body, the city/town recorder shall facilitate the 

implementation of electronic access to the member by setting up appropriate equipment and 

providing electronic access instructions to the member no later than one (1) hour prior to the 

meeting.  The first member to notify the city/town recorder of an intent to participate electronically 

shall receive the necessary information allowing them to participate electronically. 

 

SECTION 8. Effective Date. This resolution shall take effect immediately upon passage, 

the public welfare requiring it. 

 

Approved by Two-Thirds (2/3) Majority Vote on March 19, 2026 

 

 
_____________________________________    

MAYOR RUSTY TINNIN 

 

          

_____________________________________ 

CITY RECORDER 

 

 

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY 

 

____________________________________ 

CITY ATTORNEY 

 

 

 

Page 65 of 253



 

AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET 
Board of Commissioners  

City of Goodlettsville 
 
 

 
SUBJECT TITLE:  RESOLUTION 26-1325 
A resolution declaring certain property surplus to 
the needs of the City of Goodlettsville and calling 
for its disposal by online auction or any other 
reasonable manner. 
 
PRESENTED BY:   Tim Ellis, City Manager 
 

 
Agenda Item:  Resolution 26-1325 
 
Dept. of Origin:  Administration 
 
For Agenda of:  March 19, 2026 
 
Originator:  Tim Ellis 
 
Cost of Item: Positive Impact 
 

 
 

AGENDA ITEM ATTACHMENTS: 
Resolution 26-1325 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
This resolution would declare certain property surplus to the needs of the City of Goodlettsville and 
calling for its disposal by trade-in or online auction or any other reasonable manner. 
 
FINANCIAL SUMMARY: 
There would be a positive fiscal impact to the city based on the sale of the surplus property. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Staff recommends approval of Resolution 26-1325. 
 

 

 

 

 

Page 66 of 253



RESOLUTION NO. 26-1325 

A RESOLUTION DECLARING CERTAIN PROPERTY SURPLUS TO THE NEEDS OF THE CITY OF 
GOODLETTSVILLE AND CALLING FOR ITS DISPOSAL BY ONLINE AUCTION OR ANY OTHER 
REASONABLE MANNER. 

WHEREAS, occasionally, the City of Goodlettsville owns property that is no longer of use or has 
value for its intended use; and, 

WHEREAS, The City of Goodlettsville foresees no future need or use of said property; and, 

WHEREAS, The City of Goodlettsville desires to dispose of said property; 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF THE CITY OF 
GOODLETTSVILLE THAT PROPERTY LISTED IN EXHIBIT 1 OF THIS RESOLUTION IS DECLARED TO 
BE SURPLUS PROPERTY. 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED THAT SAID PROPERTY SHALL BE DISPOSED OF BY ONLINE AUCTION 
OR ANY OTHER MEANS IN ACCORDANCE WITH STATE LAW AND THE CITY’S PURCHASING 
POLICY. 

THIS RESOLUTION IS EFFECTIVE UPON ADOPTION, THE WELFARE OF THE CITIZENS OF 
GOODLETTSVILLE REQUIRING IT. 

 
_________________________   Adopted: March 19, 2026 
MAYOR RUSTY TINNIN         
 
 
_________________________ 
 CITY RECORDER 
 

APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY 

 

_________________________ 
CITY ATTORNEY 
 
 
 
 

Page 67 of 253



EXHIBIT 1 (RESOLUTION 26-1325) 
 
 

• Paramount Multi-Gym weight system 
• 5 display cases 
• HP- printer Envy 4512 with cable Serial # TH6AT4D00H unknown if it works . 
• 2 HP color laser jet printers M452nw with cords No serial number , unknown if they 

work, also have print cartridges with them.  
• HP - printer with cable  Serial # CN435FV1H6 unknown if it works 
• Dell keyboard with cable  Serial # CN-05P02F-71581  should work. 
• Lenovo keyboard with cable Serial # 375AYZG should work. 
• 1 small office desk 
• Ipad 64gb 
• Christmas Tree – approx.. 10 ft 
• Large wooden conference table 
• Small kitchenette table with 4 chairs 
• Octagon table 
• 1 black leather office chair - broken 
• 4 green office chairs - antiquated 
• 1 grey office chair - broken 
• 4 plaid maroon office chairs - antiquated 
• Acer computer monitor serial# ETLTS0R03243600ACF2442 – broken 

 
 
 
 

 
 

Page 68 of 253



 

AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET 
Board of Commissioners  

City of Goodlettsville 
 
 

 
SUBJECT TITLE:  Resolution 26-1326 
A resolution of the City of Goodlettsville, 
Tennessee, Board of Commissioners confirming 
compliance and review of financial policies and 
authorizing an application for the Comptroller’s 
Financial Excellence Award. 
 
PRESENTED BY:   Tim Ellis, City Manager 
                                
                                
 

 
Agenda Item:  Resolution 26-1326 
 
Dept. of Origin: Administration 
 
For Agenda of:  March 19, 2026 
 
Originator:  Tim Ellis 
 
Cost of Item: N/A 
 

 
 

AGENDA ITEM ATTACHMENTS: 
Resolution 26-1326 
Comptroller’s Financial Excellence Application 
Policies to Submit with Application 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
A resolution of the City of Goodlettsville, Tennessee, Board of Commissioners confirming compliance 
and review of financial policies and authorizing an application for the Comptroller’s Financial Excellence 
Award. 
 
FINANCIAL SUMMARY: 
None. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Staff recommends approval of Resolution 26-1326. 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Page 69 of 253



 

Resolution No. 26-1326 

A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY OF GOODLETTSVILLE, TENNESSEE, BOARD 
OF COMMISSIONERS CONFIRMING COMPLIANCE AND REVIEW OF 
FINANCIAL POLICIES AND AUTHORIZING AN APPLICATION FOR THE 
COMPTROLLER’S FINANCIAL EXCELLENCE AWARD  

WHEREAS the City of Goodlettsville Board of Commissioners has adopted the following financial 
policies: Capital Asset Management, Cybersecurity Plan, Debt Management, Fund Balance 
/ Unrestricted Net Position, Internal Control, Investment, Utility Billing, and Purchasing; 
and,                        

WHEREAS the City of Goodlettsville Board of Commissioners recognizes the importance of having a 
strong financial management system in place with strong financial policies to ensure that 
management will achieve its objectives for operations, budgeting, debt management, 
financial reporting, and compliance; and,   

WHEREAS the City of Goodlettsville Board of Commissioners has reviewed the requirements for the 
Comptroller’s Financial Excellence Award; and, 

WHEREAS it is the City of Goodlettsville Board of Commissioners' express intent to apply for the 
Comptroller’s Financial Excellence Award. 

 

NOW, THEREFORE, be it resolved by the Board of Commissioners of the City of Goodlettsville, 

Tennessee, that it has reviewed the aforementioned policies within the last 12 months and made or 

approved changes as needed, and hereby authorizes and requests the completion and submission of the 

application for the Comptroller’s Annual Award for Financial Excellence for fiscal year 2025-2026. 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that this Resolution shall take effect immediately upon its adoption, 
the public welfare requiring it. 

_________________________   Adopted:  March 19, 2026 
MAYOR RUSTY TINNIN 
          
________________________ 
CITY RECORDER 
 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY 

_________________________ 
CITY ATTORNEY 
 

 

Page 70 of 253



 
Comptroller’s Financial Excellence Award 

Application 
Submission Deadline: One month after your annual audit is due to be filed with the 

Comptroller’s Office 
 

Thank you for applying for the Comptroller’s Financial Excellence Award. Financial oversight 
and accountability of public dollars is crucial to the success of local governments. We commend 
you for the steps you have taken to implement practices to support financial excellence. 

Local governments that are subject to both audit and budget oversight of the Comptroller’s 
Office may apply for the award. This includes counties, metropolitan governments, 
municipalities, utility districts, municipal energy authorities, water and wastewater authorities, 
and other utility systems, such as joint ventures. 

Please submit the application and supporting documents, as one intact submission, to 
LGF@cot.tn.gov with the subject line: “Comptroller’s Financial Excellence Award.” For 
additional information or assistance, please contact LGF at LGF@cot.tn.gov. The Comptroller’s 
Office will review all applications, and the awards will be presented each fall. 
 

Step 1: Name of Local Government 
  

Enter Entity Name   

 

Step 2: Contact Information 

The authorized entity representative is meant to be the main contact our office can speak with on issues 
pertaining to the entity or application. For example, Mayor, Executive, Manager, Finance Director, etc. 

 Authorized Entity Representative Form Preparer and Submitter 

Name    

Title    

Phone    

Email    
 

Page 71 of 253

mailto:LGF@cot.tn.gov
mailto:LGF@cot.tn.gov


Comptroller’s Financial Excellence Award 
Application Document 

 

Page 2 of 4 
 

Step 3: Application Requirements 

The following items must be completed, and the requested documents must be 
submitted together with this application. 

Budgeting Yes N/A 

1. Our local government was awarded the Comptroller’s Annual 
Budget Certificate for FY 2025.   

2. Our 2025 FY audit demonstrated that we monitored the budget by 
spending within appropriated amounts and amending the budget for 
increased expenditures. 

  

Debt Management Yes N/A 

3. Our local government has outstanding debt that is rated by at least 
one nationally recognized rating agency at or above AA (Aa). 
Answering “N/A” means your local government has no debt that 
has been rated. 

  

4. A copy of the latest bond rating is attached to this application.   

Financial Management Yes N/A 

5. No audit findings were identified in the FY 2025 audit report.   

6. For Municipalities only: 
• Our municipality is in compliance with the CMFO Act.   

• Enter name of responsible party   

7. For Centralized Counties or Centralized Metropolitan 
Governments only: 

• Our centralized county or centralized metropolitan 
government has a designated Certified County Financial 
Officer (CCFO), or a CPA on staff. 

  

• Enter name of responsible party   

Page 72 of 253



Comptroller’s Financial Excellence Award 
Application Document 

 

Page 3 of 4 
 

8. For Non-Centralized Counties or Non-Centralized Metropolitan 
Governments only: 

• Our non-centralized county or non-centralized metropolitan 
has, at minimum, a CCFO in the Mayor / County 
Executive’s Office, Highway Department, and School 
Department. 

  

• Enter name of Executive’s Office responsible party   

• Enter name of Highway Department responsible party   

• Enter name of School Department responsible party   

9. Our local government demonstrates financial strength pursuant to 
the financial health metrics outlined on the Comptroller’s website 
and in the Comptroller’s debt and budget manuals (financial 
metrics contain no levels of concern or distress). 

  

Financial Oversight and Accountability – Financial Policies Yes N/A 

10. Our local government has adopted financial policies consistent with 
those required for eligibility of the award, and such policies are 
attached to this application. 

  

11. A certified copy of the resolution confirming the policies were 
reviewed is attached to this application.   

12. If applicable, our local government was not under the oversight of 
the Tennessee Board of Utility Regulation (TBOUR) during fiscal 
year 2025 for financial distress or training noncompliance. 

  

Financial Reporting and Transparency Yes N/A 

13. Our FY 2025 audit was filed timely with the Comptroller’s Office.   

14. For audits contracted with an independent CPA firm, the Division 
of Local Government Audit (LGA) did not reject our FY 2025 audit 
because of significant deficiencies. If you have not received your 
letter, check “N/A,” and LGA will review your FY 2025 audit for 
compliance with this requirement. 

  

15. Our audit did not have a modified opinion related to financial 
accounting or reporting (for example, qualified, disclaimer, or 
adverse). 

  

Page 73 of 253



Comptroller’s Financial Excellence Award 
Application Document 

 

Page 4 of 4 
 

16. Our FY 2025 audit and FY 2025 budget, including any 
amendments, are published at the following website address   

Step 4: Attestation and Signatures 

The local government indicated below hereby applies for the Comptroller’s Financial Excellence Award, and 
the following signatures of the local officials verify the submitted information is accurate. 

Name of Local Government   

 Authorized Representative Form Preparer and Submitter 

Signature    

Date    
 

Page 74 of 253



Page 75 of 253



Page 76 of 253



Page 77 of 253



Page 78 of 253



Page 79 of 253



Page 80 of 253



Page 81 of 253



Page 82 of 253



Page 83 of 253



Page 84 of 253



Page 85 of 253



Page 86 of 253



Page 87 of 253



Page 88 of 253



Page 89 of 253



Page 90 of 253



Page 91 of 253



Page 92 of 253



Page 93 of 253



Page 94 of 253



Page 95 of 253



Page 96 of 253



Page 97 of 253



Page 98 of 253



Page 99 of 253



Page 100 of 253



Page 101 of 253



Page 102 of 253



Page 103 of 253



Page 104 of 253



Page 105 of 253



Page 106 of 253



Page 107 of 253



Page 108 of 253



Page 109 of 253



Page 110 of 253



Page 111 of 253



Page 112 of 253



Page 113 of 253



Page 114 of 253



Page 115 of 253



Page 116 of 253



Page 117 of 253



Page 118 of 253



Page 119 of 253



Page 120 of 253



Page 121 of 253



Page 122 of 253



Page 123 of 253



Page 124 of 253



Page 125 of 253



Page 126 of 253



Page 127 of 253



Page 128 of 253



Page 129 of 253



Page 130 of 253



Page 131 of 253



Page 132 of 253



Page 133 of 253



Page 134 of 253



Page 135 of 253



Page 136 of 253



Page 137 of 253



Page 138 of 253



Page 139 of 253



Page 140 of 253



Page 141 of 253



Page 142 of 253



Page 143 of 253



Page 144 of 253



Page 145 of 253



Page 146 of 253



Page 147 of 253



Page 148 of 253



Page 149 of 253



Page 150 of 253



Page 151 of 253



Page 152 of 253



Page 153 of 253



Page 154 of 253



Page 155 of 253



Page 156 of 253



Page 157 of 253



Page 158 of 253



Page 159 of 253



Page 160 of 253



Page 161 of 253



Page 162 of 253



Page 163 of 253



Page 164 of 253



Page 165 of 253



Page 166 of 253



Page 167 of 253



Page 168 of 253



Page 169 of 253



Page 170 of 253



Page 171 of 253



Page 172 of 253



Page 173 of 253



Page 174 of 253



Page 175 of 253



Page 176 of 253



Page 177 of 253



Page 178 of 253



Page 179 of 253



Page 180 of 253



Page 181 of 253



Page 182 of 253



Page 183 of 253



Page 184 of 253



Page 185 of 253



Page 186 of 253



Page 187 of 253



Page 188 of 253



Page 189 of 253



Page 190 of 253



Page 191 of 253



Page 192 of 253



Page 193 of 253



Page 194 of 253



Page 195 of 253



Page 196 of 253



Page 197 of 253



Page 198 of 253



Page 199 of 253



Page 200 of 253



Page 201 of 253



Page 202 of 253



Page 203 of 253



Page 204 of 253



Page 205 of 253



Page 206 of 253



Page 207 of 253



Page 208 of 253



Page 209 of 253



Page 210 of 253



Page 211 of 253



Page 212 of 253



Page 213 of 253



Page 214 of 253



Page 215 of 253



Page 216 of 253



Page 217 of 253



Page 218 of 253



Page 219 of 253



Page 220 of 253



Page 221 of 253



Page 222 of 253



Page 223 of 253



Page 224 of 253



Page 225 of 253



Page 226 of 253



Page 227 of 253



Page 228 of 253



Page 229 of 253



Page 230 of 253



Page 231 of 253



Page 232 of 253



Page 233 of 253



Page 234 of 253



Page 235 of 253



Page 236 of 253



Page 237 of 253



Page 238 of 253



Page 239 of 253



Page 240 of 253



 

AGENDA SUMMARY SHEET 
Board of Commissioners  

City of Goodlettsville 
 
 

 
SUBJECT TITLE:  Resolution 26-1327 
A resolution of the Board of Commissioners of 
the City of Goodlettsville approving a grant 
contract with the Tennessee Commission for the 
United States Semiquincentennial for the 
Tennessee America 250 Community Support 
Grant. 
 
PRESENTED BY:   Tim Ellis, City Manager 
                                
 

 
Agenda Item:  Resolution 26-1327 
 
Dept. of Origin:  Administration  
 
For Agenda of:  March 19, 2026 
 
Originator:  Tim Ellis 
 
Cost of Item: 100% Grant Funded  - $9,090.00 
 

 
 

AGENDA ITEM ATTACHMENTS: 
Resolution 26-1327 
 
SUMMARY STATEMENT: 
A resolution of the Board of Commissioners of the City of Goodlettsville approving a grant contract with 
the Tennessee Commission for the United States Semiquincentennial for the Tennessee America 250 
Community Support Grant. 
 
FINANCIAL SUMMARY: 
100% Grant Funded - $9,090.00 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
Staff recommends approval of Resolution 26-1327. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

Page 241 of 253



RESOLUTION NO. 26-1327 

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF THE CITY OF GOODLETTSVILLE 
APPROVING A GRANT CONTRACT WITH THE TENNESSEE COMMISSION FOR THE UNITED 
STATES SEMIQUINCENTINNIAL FOR THE TENNESSEE AMERICA 250 COMMUNITY SUPPORT 
GRANT. 

WHEREAS, the Tennessee Commission for the United States Semiquincentennial was established to coordinate 
statewide efforts commemorating the 250th anniversary of the founding of the United States, commonly known 
as Tennessee America 250; and 

WHEREAS, the City of Goodlettsville has applied for and been awarded grant funding through the Tennessee 
America 250 Community Support Grant Program to support local initiatives recognizing and celebrating the 
nation’s 250th anniversary; and 

WHEREAS, the grant funds will assist the City in developing exhibits, educational displays, and related 
programming that highlight the community’s history and contributions to the nation’s heritage; and 

WHEREAS, participation in the Tennessee America 250 initiative provides an opportunity for the City to engage 
residents and visitors in commemorating this historic milestone while promoting civic pride, education, and 
tourism; and 

WHEREAS, the Tennessee Commission for the United States Semiquincentennial requires the City to enter into 
a grant contract outlining the terms, conditions, and responsibilities associated with the funding; and 

WHEREAS, the Board of Commissioners finds that acceptance of this grant and approval of the associated 
contract is in the best interest of the City and its citizens. 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED by the Board of Commissioners of the City of Goodlettsville that: 

1. The Board of Commissioners hereby approves the grant contract shown here as Exhibit I between the City 
of Goodlettsville and the Tennessee Commission for the United States Semiquincentennial for the 
Tennessee America 250 Community Support Grant. 

2. The Board authorizes the City Manager to execute all necessary documents and agreements required to 
accept and administer the grant on behalf of the City. 

3. The City Manager and appropriate City staff are authorized to take all actions necessary to implement the 
grant project in accordance with the terms and conditions of the agreement. 

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that this Resolution shall take effect immediately upon its adoption, the 
public welfare requiring it. 

_________________________   Adopted:  March 19, 2026 
MAYOR RUSTY TINNIN 
          
________________________ 
CITY RECORDER 
 
APPROVED AS TO FORM AND LEGALITY 

_________________________ 
CITY ATTORNEY 

Page 242 of 253



09-18-25 GE 

 
 

 

E N D O W M E N T  G R A N T  C O N T R A C T  

Begin Date End Date Agency Tracking # Edison ID 

7/1/25 6/30/26 31627-250 89231 

Public Chapter 

530 

Bill # 

HB1409 

Section 

36 

Item 

30 

Grantee Legal Entity Name Edison Vendor ID 

City of Goodlettsville  

Service Caption (one line only) 

Semi Quincentennial Celebration 

Funding — 

FY State Federal 
Interdepartmenta
l Other 

TOTAL Contract 
Amount 

2026 $9,090.00 0 0 0 $9,090.00 

                                    

                                    

                                    

                                    

TOTAL
: $9,090.00 0 0 0 $9,090.00 

Grantee Selection Process Summary 

 Competitive selection Grantee organizations applied for funding via a competitive process 
requiring submission of applications during a specific cycle. Each application 
included project descriptions, supporting project budget and agency 
operating budgets. Applications were reviewed by TSM staff and assessed 
by other subject matter experts. The members of the Tennessee 
Commission for the U.S. Semiquincentennial reviewed and provided the final 
approval. 

 Non-competitive selection  

Budget Officer Confirmation:  There is a balance in the 
appropriation from which obligations hereunder are 
required to be paid that is not already encumbered to pay 
other obligations. 

CPO USE - EG 

Speed Chart (optional) Account Code (optional) 

SM39       
 

 

Page 243 of 253



09-18-25 GE 

 

1 

GRANT CONTRACT 
BETWEEN THE STATE OF TENNESSEE, 

TENNESSEE STATE MUSEUM  
AND 

CITY OF GOODLETTSVILLE 
 
This Grant Contract, by and between the State of Tennessee, Tennessee State Museum, hereinafter 
referred to as the “State” or the “Grantor State Agency” and City of Goodlettsville hereinafter referred to 
as the “Grantee,” is for the provision of Semi Quincentennial Celebration , as further defined in the 
"SCOPE OF SERVICES AND DELIVERABLES." 
 
The Grantee is a Tennessee Government Entity.  
Grantee Place of Incorporation or Organization:  Goodlettsville, TN 
Grantee Edison Vendor ID #  
 
Scope 1: 
 
A. SCOPE OF SERVICES AND DELIVERABLES: 
 
A.1. The Grantee shall provide the scope of services and deliverables (“Scope”) as required, 

described, and detailed in this Grant Contract. 
 
A.2  To support the TN Semiquincentennial Celebration (America250 or TN250) – Funding was 

included in the Governor’s budget to the State Museum to support Tennessee's participation in 
the United States Semiquincentennial Celebration. The TN Semiquincentennial Commission 
developed a grant program for organizations across the state to apply for funding to promote and 
market the celebration in their respective areas.  

 
A.3  The Tennessee Commission for the United States Semiquincentennial offers two grant 

opportunities for organizations and communities centered around Tennessee’s unique stories.  
 
A.4.  Service Description. To utilize funding in preparation and celebration for the TN 

Semiquincentennial.  
 
A.5.  Archival Support  
 

a. Collection Maintenance. It is acceptable to replace or purchase archival supplies to 

improve the storage conditions, operations, or public accessibility of archival collections, 

particularly those related to TN Semiquincentennial and Tennessee’s role leading to that 

event. Such as the following: 

1) Archival shelving units 

2) Acid-free, lignin-free folders and boxes 

3) Other necessary archival supplies or environmental monitoring devices 

4) Contracted conservation treatments 

5) Hiring part-time workers to process collections or to plan digitization projects 

6) Improving online access to collections through digitization 

 

b. Collection Preservation and Professional Development. It is acceptable to improve 

preservation of and access to Tennessee’s historical records (including digitization), 

especially those that highlight Tennessee’s contributions to TN Semiquincentennial and 

the founding of the United States. This includes educating and training records custodians 

and supporting archival program development and enhancement. Such as for the 

following: 

Page 244 of 253



09-18-25 GE 

 

2 

1) Technology: This sub-category provides funding for hardware, software, 

peripherals, and other technology items used/needed to create online digital 

collections, especially those related to Tennessee’s role in the founding of 

the United States.  

2) Training: This sub-category provides funding for registration costs for 

webinars or workshops related to conservation, digitization, and digital 

project planning for archivists and museum personnel. 

3) Contracted Services: This sub-category provides funding to hire a vendor or 

independent contractor for digitization or conservation services, particularly 

for work on collections that highlight Tennessee’s contributions to America’s 

founding. Include a vendor quote for these services with your application. 

4) Contract/Part-Time Archivist: This sub-category provides funding to hire a 

contract or part-time archivist for the duration of the grant period to scan 

documents and create corresponding metadata for collections related to 

Tennessee’s history and America 250. 

 

A.6.  Historic Preservation. It is acceptable to support historic preservation projects that focus on 
interpreting and preserving Tennessee’s unique stories, objects, landmarks, and places across 
our diverse state that defined who we are as Tennesseans and Americans. Such as for the 
following: 

 
a. Historic Structure Restoration and Repair 

b. Historic Cemetery Restoration  

 

A.7.  Exhibition and Programs. It is acceptable to support exhibitions and programs that focus on 
interpreting and preserving Tennessee’s unique stories, objects, landmarks, and places across 
our diverse state that defined who we are as Tennesseans and Americans. SA.6 such as the 
following: 

 
a. Public exhibitions, both long-standing and temporary, that support the themes of the 

nation’s anniversary 

b. Educational lectures or symposia related to the Semiquincentennial 

1) Community history projects, including oral histories 

2) Conferences and symposia 

3) Festivals and performances 

4) Lectures and lecture series 

 

A.8.  Media Programs. It is acceptable to support media programs that focus on marketing, interpreting 
and preserving Tennessee’s unique stories, objects, landmarks, and places across our diverse 
state that defined who we are as Tennesseans and Americans. Such as the following: 

 
a. production support of films 

b. videos, 

c. television,  

d. radio,  

e. podcasts,  

f. websites, or  

g. digital media 

Page 245 of 253



09-18-25 GE 

 

3 

A.9.  Incorporation of Additional Documents.  Each of the following documents is included as a part of 
this Grant Contract by reference or attachment.  In the event of a discrepancy or ambiguity 
regarding the Grantee's duties, responsibilities, and performance hereunder, these items shall 
govern in order of precedence below. 

 
a. this Grant Contract document with any attachments or exhibits (excluding the items listed 

at subsections b. and c., below); 

b. the State grant proposal solicitation as may be amended, if any; 

c. the Grantee’s proposal (Grantee Application) incorporated to elaborate supplementary 

scope of services specifications. 

Scope 2:  
 
A. SCOPE OF SERVICE AND DELIVERABLES: 
 
A.1. The Grantee shall provide the scope of services and deliverables (“Scope”) as required, 

described, and detailed in this Grant Contract. 
 
A.2  To support the TN Semiquincentennial Celebration (America250 or TN250) – Funding was 

included in the Governor’s budget to the State Museum to support Tennessee's participation in 
the United States Semiquincentennial Celebration. The TN Semiquincentennial Commission 
developed a grant program for organizations across the state to apply for funding to promote and 
market the celebration in their respective areas.  

 
A.3  The Tennessee Commission for the United States Semiquincentennial offers two grant 

opportunities for organizations and communities centered around Tennessee’s unique stories.  
 
A.4.  Service Description.  To utilize funding in preparation and celebration for the TN 

Semiquincentennial. 
 
A.5.  Community Support Groups. To assist with two or more collaborating in their TN 

Semiquincentennial activities, such as: 
a. county/ municipality organizations 

b. non-profit 501(c) and 501(a) organizations 

c. local historical societies,  

d. libraries,  

e. museums  

f. other applicable organizations 

A.6.  Incorporation of Additional Documents.  Each of the following documents is included as a part of 
this Grant Contract by reference or attachment.  In the event of a discrepancy or ambiguity 
regarding the Grantee's duties, responsibilities, and performance hereunder, these items shall 
govern in order of precedence below. 

 

a. this Grant Contract document with any attachments or exhibits (excluding the 

items listed at subsections b. and c., below); 

b. the State grant proposal solicitation as may be amended, if any; 

c. the Grantee’s proposal (Grantee Application) incorporated to elaborate 

supplementary scope of services specifications. 

 

B. TERM OF CONTRACT: 
 

Page 246 of 253



09-18-25 GE 

 

4 

 This Grant Contract shall be effective on July 1, 2025 (“Effective Date”) and extend for a period of 
twelve (12) months after the Effective Date (“Term”).  The State shall have no obligation  

 to the Grantee for fulfillment of the Scope outside the Term.  
 
 
C. PAYMENT TERMS AND CONDITIONS:   
 
C.1. Maximum Liability.  In no event shall the maximum liability of the State under this Grant Contract 

exceed nine thousand ninety dollars ($9,090.00) (“Maximum Liability”).   
 
C.2. Compensation Firm.  The Maximum Liability of the State is not subject to escalation for any 

reason unless amended.   
 
C.3. Payment Methodology – Total Advance Payment.  The Grantee shall be reimbursed for actual, 

reasonable, and necessary costs, not to exceed the maximum liability established in section C.1.  
Payment to the Grantee shall be a lump sum made in advance upon approval of this Grant 
Contract. 
 

C.4. Expenditures and Accounting.  The expenditure of funds made available through this Grant 
Contract shall adhere to the Scope of Services.  Said expenditures shall be made during the 
Grant Contract period and shall not be carried forward.  The Grantee shall submit an 
Expenditures and Accounting report within sixty (60) days following the end of the Grant Contract.  
Said report shall demonstrate compliance with the Scope of Services and shall be in form and 
substance acceptable to the State. 

 
C.5. State’s Right to Set Off.  The State reserves the right to set off or deduct from amounts that are or 

shall become due and payable to the Grantee under this Grant Contract or under any other 
agreement between the Grantee and the State of Tennessee under which the Grantee has a right 
to receive payment from the State. 

 
C.6. Prerequisite Documentation.  The Grantee shall not receive the funds under the endowment grant 

until the State has received the following:   
 
a. A Grantee completed and signed State provided W-9 form.  The taxpayer identification 

number on the W-9 form must be the same as the Grantee’s Federal Employer 
Identification Number or Social Security Number referenced in the Grantee’s Edison 
registration information.  

 
D. STANDARD TERMS AND CONDITIONS: 
 
D.1. Required Approvals.  The State is not bound by this Grant Contract until it is signed by the parties 

and approved by appropriate officials in accordance with applicable Tennessee laws and 
regulations (depending upon the specifics of this contract, the officials may include, but are not 
limited to, the Commissioner of Finance and Administration, the Commissioner of Human 
Resources, and the Comptroller of the Treasury). 

 
D.2. Modification and Amendment.  This Grant Contract may be modified only by a written amendment 

signed by all parties and approved by the officials who approved the Grant Contract and, 
depending upon the specifics of the Grant Contract as amended, any additional officials required 
by Tennessee laws and regulations (the officials may include, but are not limited to, the 
Commissioner of Finance and Administration, the Commissioner of Human Resources, and the 
Comptroller of the Treasury). 

 
D.3. Termination for Convenience.  The State may terminate this Grant Contract without cause for any 

reason.  A termination for convenience shall not be a breach of this Grant Contract by the State.  
The State shall give the Grantee at least thirty (30) days written notice before the effective 

Page 247 of 253



09-18-25 GE 

 

5 

termination date.  The Grantee shall be entitled to compensation for authorized expenditures and 
satisfactory services completed as of the termination date, but in no event shall the State be liable 
to the Grantee for compensation for any service that has not been rendered.  The final decision 
as to the amount for which the State is liable shall be determined by the State.   The Grantee 
shall not have any right to any actual general, special, incidental, consequential, or any other 
damages whatsoever of any description or amount for the State’s exercise of its right to terminate 
for convenience. 

 
D.4. Termination for Cause.  If the Grantee fails to properly perform its obligations under this Grant 

Contract in a timely or proper manner, or if the Grantee violates any terms of this Grant Contract, 
the State shall have the right to immediately terminate the Grant Contract and withhold payments 
in excess of fair compensation for completed services.  Notwithstanding the exercise of the 
State’s right to terminate this Grant Contract for cause, the Grantee shall not be relieved of 
liability to the State for damages sustained by virtue of any breach of this Grant Contract by the 
Grantee. 

 
D.5. Subcontracting.  The Grantee shall not assign this Grant Contract or enter into a subcontract for 

any of the services performed under this Grant Contract without obtaining the prior written 
approval of the State.  If such subcontracts are approved by the State, each shall contain, at a 
minimum, sections of this contract pertaining to "Conflicts of Interest," "Nondiscrimination," 
“Public Accountability,” “Public Notice,” and “Records" (as identified by the section headings).  
Notwithstanding any use of approved subcontractors, the Grantee shall remain responsible for all 
work performed. 

 
D.6. Conflicts of Interest.  The Grantee warrants that no part of the total Grant Contract Amount shall 

be paid directly or indirectly to an employee or official of the State of Tennessee as wages, 
compensation, or gifts in exchange for acting as an officer, agent, employee, subcontractor, or 
consultant to the Grantee in connection with any work contemplated or performed relative to this 
Grant Contract.  

 
D.7. Communications and Contacts.  All instructions, notices, consents, demands, or other 

communications required or contemplated by this Grant Contract shall be emailed to the 
respective party as set out below:   
The State: 
 
Carrie Tipton, America 250 Coordinator 
Tennessee State Museum  
TN250@tn.gov 
Telephone #  (615) 712-1371 
 
 
The Grantee: 
 
David Anderson, Project Director 
City of Goodlettsville 
105 South Main Street 

 Goodlettsville,TN 37072 
danderson@goodlettsville.gov 
Telephone #  16157958885 
 
 
A change to the above contact information requires written notice to the person designated by the 
other party to receive notice.    

 
All instructions, notices, consents, demands, or other communications shall be considered 
effectively given upon receipt or recipient confirmation as may be required. 

Page 248 of 253



09-18-25 GE 

 

6 

 
D.8. Subject to Funds Availability.  This Grant Contract is subject to the appropriation and availability 

of State funds.  In the event that the funds are not appropriated or are otherwise unavailable, the 
State reserves the right to terminate this Grant Contract upon written notice to the Grantee.  The 
State’s right to terminate this Grant Contract due to lack of funds is not a breach of this Grant 
Contract by the State.  Upon receipt of the written notice, the Grantee shall cease all work 
associated with the Grant Contract.  Should such an event occur, the Grantee shall be entitled to 
compensation for all satisfactory and authorized services completed as of the termination date.  
Upon such termination, the Grantee shall have no right to recover from the State any actual, 
general, special, incidental, consequential, or any other damages whatsoever of any description 
or amount. 

 
D.9. Nondiscrimination.  The Grantee hereby agrees, warrants, and assures that no person shall be 

excluded from participation in, be denied benefits of, or be otherwise subjected to discrimination 
in the performance of this Grant Contract or in the employment practices of the Grantee on the 
grounds of handicap or disability, age, race, color, religion, sex, national origin, or any other 
classification protected by Federal, Tennessee State constitutional, or statutory law.  The Grantee 
shall, upon request, show proof of such nondiscrimination and shall post in conspicuous places, 
available to all employees and applicants, notices of nondiscrimination. 

 
D.10. Public Accountability.  If the Grantee is subject to Tenn. Code Ann. § 8-4-401 et seq., or if this 

Grant Contract involves the provision of services to citizens by the Grantee on behalf of the State, 
the Grantee agrees to establish a system through which recipients of services may present 
grievances about the operation of the service program, and the Grantee shall display in a 
prominent place, located near the passageway through which the public enters in order to receive 
Grant supported services, a sign at least eleven inches (11") in height and seventeen inches (17") 
in width stating: 
 
NOTICE:  THIS AGENCY IS A RECIPIENT OF TAXPAYER FUNDING. IF YOU OBSERVE AN 
AGENCY DIRECTOR OR EMPLOYEE ENGAGING IN ANY ACTIVITY WHICH YOU CONSIDER 
TO BE ILLEGAL, IMPROPER, OR WASTEFUL, PLEASE CALL THE STATE COMPTROLLER’S 
TOLL-FREE HOTLINE:  1-800-232-5454 

 
 The sign shall be on the form prescribed by the Comptroller of the Treasury.  The Grantor State 

Agency shall obtain copies of the sign from the Comptroller of the Treasury, and upon request 
from the Grantee, provide Grantee with any necessary signs. 

 
D.11.  Public Notice.  All notices, informational pamphlets, press releases, research reports, signs, and 

similar public notices prepared and released by the Grantee shall include the statement, “This 
project is funded under an agreement with the State of Tennessee administered by the 
Tennessee Commission for the United States Semiquincentennial.”  ”   

 
 All notices by the Grantee in relation to this Grant Contract shall be approved by the State. 
 
D.12. Records.  The Grantee and any approved subcontractor shall maintain documentation for all 

charges under this Grant Contract.  The books, records, and documents of the Grantee and any 
approved subcontractor, insofar as they relate to work performed or money received under this 
Grant Contract, shall be maintained in accordance with applicable Tennessee law.  In no case 
shall the records be maintained for a period of less than five (5) full years from the date of the 
final payment.  The Grantee’s records shall be subject to audit at any reasonable time and upon 
reasonable notice by the Grantor State Agency, the Comptroller of the Treasury, or their duly 
appointed representatives.   

 The records shall be maintained in accordance with Governmental Accounting Standards Board 
 (GASB) Accounting Standards or the Financial Accounting Standards Board (FASB) Accounting 

Page 249 of 253



09-18-25 GE 

 

7 

 Standards Codification, as applicable, and any related AICPA Industry Audit and Accounting 
 guides.   

 In addition, documentation of grant applications, budgets, reports, awards, and expenditures will 
 be maintained in accordance with U.S. Office of Management and Budget’s Uniform 
 Administrative Requirements, Cost Principles, and Audit Requirements for Federal Awards. 

 Grant expenditures shall be made in accordance with local government purchasing policies and 
 procedures and purchasing procedures for local governments authorized under state law. 

 The Grantee shall also comply with any recordkeeping and reporting requirements prescribed by 
 the Tennessee Comptroller of the Treasury. 

 The Grantee shall establish a system of internal controls that utilize the COSO Internal Control - 
 Integrated Framework model as the basic foundation for the internal control system.  The Grantee 
 shall incorporate any additional Comptroller of the Treasury directives into its internal control 
 system. 

 Any other required records or reports which are not contemplated in the above standards shall 
 follow the format designated by the head of the Grantor State Agency, the Central Procurement 
 Office, or the Commissioner of Finance and Administration of the State of Tennessee. 

D.13. Monitoring.  The Grantee’s activities conducted and records maintained pursuant to this Grant 
Contract shall be subject to monitoring and evaluation by the State, the Comptroller of the 
Treasury, or their duly appointed representatives. 

 
D.14. Progress Reports.  The Grantee shall submit brief, periodic, progress reports to the State as 

requested. 
 
D.15. Annual and Final Reports.  As a prerequisite to the receipt of grant funds, the Grantee shall agree 

to provide to the State agency head, within sixty (60) days of the close of the project, an 
accounting of the actual expenditure of such funds including a notarized statement that the report 
is true and correct in all material respects; provided, however, that the head of the State agency 
through which such disbursement is being made may require, in lieu of the accounting as 
provided above, an audited financial statement of the non-governmental agency or entity. A copy 
of such accounting or audit, as the case may be, also shall be filed with the office of the 
Comptroller of the Treasury 

 
D.16. Strict Performance.  Failure by any party to this Grant Contract to insist in any one or more cases 

upon the strict performance of any of the terms, covenants, conditions, or provisions of this 
agreement shall not be construed as a waiver or relinquishment of any such term, covenant, 
condition, or provision. No term or condition of this Grant Contract shall be held to be waived, 
modified, or deleted except by a written amendment signed by the parties. 

 
D.17. Independent Contractor.  The parties shall not act as employees, partners, joint venturers, or 

associates of one another in the performance of this Grant Contract.  The parties acknowledge 
that they are independent contracting entities and that nothing in this Grant Contract shall be 
construed to create a principal/agent relationship or to allow either to exercise control or direction 
over the manner or method by which the other transacts its business affairs or provides its usual 
services.  The employees or agents of one party shall not be deemed or construed to be the 
employees or agents of the other party for any purpose whatsoever. 
 
The Grantee, being an independent contractor and not an employee of the State, agrees to carry 
adequate public liability and other appropriate forms of insurance, including adequate public 
liability and other appropriate forms of insurance on the Grantee’s employees, and to pay all 
applicable taxes incident to this Grant Contract. 

 

Page 250 of 253



09-18-25 GE 

 

8 

D.18. State Liability.  The State shall have no liability except as specifically provided in this Grant 
Contract. 

 
D.19. Force Majeure.  “Force Majeure Event” means fire, flood, earthquake, elements of nature or acts 

of God, wars, riots, civil disorders, rebellions or revolutions, acts of terrorism or any other similar 
cause beyond the reasonable control of the party except to the extent that the non-performing 
party is at fault in failing to prevent or causing the default or delay, and provided that the default 
or delay cannot reasonably be circumvented by the non-performing party through the use of 
alternate sources, workaround plans or other means.  A strike, lockout or labor dispute shall not 
excuse either party from its obligations under this Grant Contract.  Except as set forth in this 
Section, any failure or delay by a party in the performance of its obligations under this Grant 
Contract arising from a Force Majeure Event is not a default under this Grant Contract or grounds 
for termination.  The non-performing party will be excused from performing those obligations 
directly affected by the Force Majeure Event, and only for as long as the Force Majeure Event 
continues, provided that the party continues to use diligent, good faith efforts to resume 
performance without delay.  The occurrence of a Force Majeure Event affecting Grantee’s 
representatives, suppliers, subcontractors, customers or business apart from this Grant Contract 
is not a Force Majeure Event under this Grant Contract.  Grantee will promptly notify the State of 
any delay caused by a Force Majeure Event (to be confirmed in a written notice to the State 
within one (1) day of the inception of the delay) that a Force Majeure Event has occurred, and will 
describe in reasonable detail the nature of the Force Majeure Event.  If any Force Majeure Event 
results in a delay in Grantee’s performance longer than forty-eight (48) hours, the State may, 
upon notice to Grantee: (a) cease payment of the fees until Grantee resumes performance of the 
affected obligations; or (b) immediately terminate this Grant Contract or any purchase order, in 
whole or in part, without further payment except for fees then due and payable.  Grantee will not 
increase its charges under this Grant Contract or charge the State any fees other than those 
provided for in this Grant Contract as the result of a Force Majeure Event. 

 
D. 20. State and Federal Compliance.  The Grantee shall comply with all applicable state and federal 

laws and regulations in the performance of this Grant Contract. The U.S. Office of Management 
and Budget’s Administrative Requirements, Cost Principles, and Audit Requirements for Federal 
Awards is available here: http://www.ecfr.gov/cgi-bin/text-
idx?SID=c6b2f053952359ba94470ad3a7c1a975&tpl=/ecfrbrowse/Title02/2cfr200_main_02.tpl   

 
D.21. Governing Law.  This Grant Contract shall be governed by and construed in accordance with the 

laws of the State of Tennessee, without regard to its conflict or choice of law rules.  The Grantee 
agrees that it will be subject to the exclusive jurisdiction of the courts of the State of Tennessee in 
actions that may arise under this Grant Contract.  The Grantee acknowledges and agrees that 
any rights or claims against the State of Tennessee or its employees hereunder, and any 
remedies arising there from, shall be subject to and limited to those rights and remedies, if any, 
available under Tenn. Code Ann. §§ 9-8-101 through 9-8-408. 

 
D.22. Completeness.  This Grant Contract is complete and contains the entire understanding between 

the parties relating to the subject matter contained herein, including all the terms and conditions 
of the parties’ agreement.  This Grant Contract supersedes any and all prior understandings, 
representations, negotiations, and agreements between the parties relating hereto, whether 
written or oral. 

 
D.23. Severability.  If any terms and conditions of this Grant Contract are held to be invalid or 

unenforceable as a matter of law, the other terms and conditions hereof shall not be affected 
thereby and shall remain in full force and effect.  To this end, the terms and conditions of this 
Grant Contract are declared severable. 

 
D.24. Headings.  Section headings are for reference purposes only and shall not be construed as part 

of this Grant Contract. 
 

Page 251 of 253

http://www.ecfr.gov/cgi-bin/text-idx?SID=c6b2f053952359ba94470ad3a7c1a975&tpl=/ecfrbrowse/Title02/2cfr200_main_02.tpl
http://www.ecfr.gov/cgi-bin/text-idx?SID=c6b2f053952359ba94470ad3a7c1a975&tpl=/ecfrbrowse/Title02/2cfr200_main_02.tpl


09-18-25 GE 

 

9 

D.25.    Debarment and Suspension.  The Grantee certifies, to the best of its knowledge and belief, that it, 
its current and future principals, its current and future subcontractors and their principals: 

               
 a. are not presently debarred, suspended, proposed for debarment, declared ineligible, or 

 voluntarily excluded from covered transactions by any federal or state department or 
 agency; 

 
 b. have not within a three (3) year period preceding this Grant Contract been convicted of, 

 or had a civil judgment rendered against them from commission of fraud, or a criminal 
 offence in connection with obtaining, attempting to obtain, or performing a public 
 (federal, state, or local) transaction or grant under a public transaction; violation of 
 federal or state antitrust statutes or commission of embezzlement, theft, forgery, bribery, 
 falsification, or destruction of records, making false statements, or receiving stolen 
 property; 

 
 c. are not presently indicted or otherwise criminally or civilly charged by a government 

 entity (federal, state, or local) with commission of any of the offenses detailed in section 
 b. of this certification;  and 

 
 d. have not within a three (3) year period preceding this Grant Contract had one or more 

 public transactions (federal, state, or local) terminated for cause or default.  
           

 The Grantee shall provide immediate written notice to the State if at any time it learns that there 
was an earlier failure to disclose information or that due to changed circumstances, its principals 
or the principals of its subcontractors are excluded or disqualified, or presently fall under any of 
the prohibitions of sections a-d. 

 
D.26.     Confidentiality of Records.  Strict standards of confidentiality of records and information shall be 

maintained in accordance with applicable state and federal law.  All material and information, 
regardless of form, medium or method of communication, provided to the Grantee by the State or 
acquired by the Grantee on behalf of the State that is regarded as confidential under state or 
federal law shall be regarded as “Confidential Information.”  Nothing in this Section shall permit 
Grantee to disclose any Confidential Information, regardless of whether it has been disclosed or 
made available to the Grantee due to intentional or negligent actions or inactions of agents of the 
State or third parties.  Confidential Information shall not be disclosed except as required or 
permitted under state or federal law.  Grantee shall take all necessary steps to safeguard the 
confidentiality of such material or information in conformance with applicable state and federal 
law.    

              
             The obligations set forth in this Section shall survive the termination of this Grant Contract. 
 
E. SPECIAL TERMS AND CONDITIONS:  
 
E.1. Conflicting Terms and Conditions.  Should any of these special terms and conditions conflict with 

any other terms and conditions of this Grant Contract, the special terms and conditions shall be 
subordinate to the Grant Contract’s other terms and conditions. 

 
 

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, 

CITY OF GOODLETTSVILLE: 

Page 252 of 253



09-18-25 GE 

 

10 

 

GRANTEE SIGNATURE DATE 

 

PRINTED NAME AND TITLE OF GRANTEE SIGNATORY (above)  

TENNESSEE STATE MUSEUM: 

 

Ashley Howell, Executive Director DATE 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

Page 253 of 253


	1. Call to order by the Mayor
	 Prayer
	 Pledge of Allegiance
	2. Roll call by the Recorder. 
	3. Comments from citizens. 
	4. Comments of the City Manager and staff. 
	5. Reports and comments from committees, members of the Board of Commissioners and other officers. 
	6. Consent agenda items.
	7. Unfinished Business.
	a. Consider Ordinance 26-1133, an ordinance to amend 
	Summary Sheet for Ordinance 26-1133
	26-1133 Building Code

	b. Consider Ordinance 26-1135, an ordinance of the Ci
	Summary Sheet for Ordinance 26-1135
	Ordinance 26-1135 Emergency Services

	c. Consider Resolution 26-1319, a resolution of the B
	Summary Sheet for Resolution 26-1319
	26-1319 IDD


	8. New Business. 
	a. Consider Ordinance 26-1136, an ordinance to amend 
	Summary Sheet for Ordinance 26-1136
	Ordinance 26-1136 SPRINGFIELDHWYZONINGORDINANCEAMENDMENT
	Ordinance 26-1136 Planning Commission Review

	b. Consider Ordinance 26-1137, an ordinance to amend 
	Summary Sheet for Ordinance 26-1137
	26-1137 DRYCREEKROADZONINGMAPAMENDMENT
	Planning Commission Review

	c. Consider Ordinance 26-1138, an ordinance to amend 
	Summary Sheet for Ordinance 26-1138
	26-1138 DRYCREEKROADOLDDICKERSONZONINGMAPAMENDMENT
	 Planning Commission Review

	d. Consider Ordinance 26-1139, an ordinance of the Ci
	Summary Sheet for Ordinance 26-1139 Budget Amendment
	Ordinance 26-1139 Budget Amendment

	e. Consider Resolution 26-1322, a resolution of the B
	Summary Sheet for Resolution 26-1322
	RESOLUTION 26-1322 Opposition to Annexation Approval

	f. Consider Resolution 26-1323, a resolution of the B
	Summary Sheet for Resolution 26-1323
	RESOLUTION 26-1323  Opposition to Property Tax Cap

	g. Consider Resolution 26-1324, a resolution of the C
	Summary Sheet for Resolution 26-1324
	Resolution 26-1324   Electronic Participation Meetings

	h. Consider Resolution 26-1325, a resolution declarin
	Resolution 26-1325 Surplus Property
	Surplus Exhibit 1325

	i. Consider Resolution 26-1326, a resolution of the C
	Summary Sheet for Resolution 26-1326
	Resolution 26-1326 Financial Excellence Resolution COT
	26-1326 Financial Excellence Application
	26-1326 Policies

	j. Consider Resolution 26-1327, a resolution of the C
	Summary Sheet for Resolution 26-1327
	Resolution 26-1327 America 250 Grant
	26-1327 Grant Contract


	9. Adjournment.

	Enter Entity Name: City of Goodlettsville
	Authorized Entity RepresentativeName: Tim Ellis
	Form Preparer and SubmitterName: Julie High
	Authorized Entity RepresentativeTitle: City Manager
	Form Preparer and SubmitterTitle: Assistant City Manager
	Authorized Entity RepresentativePhone: 615-851-2200
	Form Preparer and SubmitterPhone: 615-851-2201
	Authorized Entity RepresentativeEmail: tellis@goodlettsville.gov
	Form Preparer and SubmitterEmail: jhigh@goodlettsville.gov
	6 For Municipalities only  Our municipality is in compliance with the CMFO Act  Enter name of responsible party: Julie High
	7 For Centralized Counties or Centralized Metropolitan Governments only  Our centralized county or centralized metropolitan government has a designated Certified County Financial Officer CCFO or a CPA on staff  Enter name of responsible party: 
	8 For NonCentralized Counties or NonCentralized Metropolitan Governments only  Our noncentralized county or noncentralized metropolitan has at minimum a CCFO in the Mayor  County Executives Office Highway Department and School Department  Enter name of Executives Office responsible party   Enter name of Highway Department responsible party   Enter name of School Department responsible party: 
	8 For NonCentralized Counties or NonCentralized Metropolitan Governments only  Our noncentralized county or noncentralized metropolitan has at minimum a CCFO in the Mayor  County Executives Office Highway Department and School Department  Enter name of Executives Office responsible party   Enter name of Highway Department responsible party   Enter name of School Department responsible party_2: 
	8 For NonCentralized Counties or NonCentralized Metropolitan Governments only  Our noncentralized county or noncentralized metropolitan has at minimum a CCFO in the Mayor  County Executives Office Highway Department and School Department  Enter name of Executives Office responsible party   Enter name of Highway Department responsible party   Enter name of School Department responsible party_3: 
	16 Our FY 2025 audit and FY 2025 budget including any amendments are published at the following website address: www.goodlettsville.gov
	Name of Local Government: 
	Authorized RepresentativeSignature: 
	Form Preparer and SubmitterSignature: 
	Authorized RepresentativeDate: 
	Form Preparer and SubmitterDate: 
	Check Box1: 
	0: 
	0: Yes
	1: Off

	1: 
	0: Yes
	1: Off

	2: 
	0: Yes
	1: Off

	3: 
	0: Yes
	1: Off

	4: 
	0: Yes
	1: Off

	5: 
	1: Off
	0: Yes

	6: 
	1: Yes
	0: Off


	Check Box2: 
	0: 
	0: Off
	1: Off

	1: 
	0: Yes
	1: Off

	2: 
	0: Yes
	1: Off

	3: 
	0: Yes
	1: Off

	4: 
	0: Yes
	1: Off

	5: 
	0: Yes
	1: Off

	6: 
	0: Yes
	1: Off

	7: 
	0: Yes
	1: Off




